OFFICE OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW

REGISTER 2012, NO. 40-Z PUBLISHED WEEKLY BY THE OFFICE OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW OCTOBER 5, 2012

PROPOSED ACTION ON REGULATIONS
TITLE 14. BOARD OF FORESTRY AND FIRE PROTECTION

Sate Responsibility Area Fire Prevention Benefit Fee 2012 — Notice File No. Z2012-0925-04 . .............. 1453
TITLE 14. STATE MINING AND GEOLOGY BOARD

Palm Springs Production Consumption Region Designation — Notice File No. Z2012-0924-02 .............. 1456
TITLE 14. STATE MINING AND GEOLOGY BOARD

San Gabriel Valley Production Consumption Region Designation — Notice File No. Z2012-0924-03 .......... 1463
TITLE15. DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS AND REHABILITATION

Visiting Searches—Notice File N0. Z2012—0025-0L . . . . ... ..ottt e e e 1469
TITLE17. CALIFORNIA INSTITUTE FOR REGENERATIVE MEDICINE

Intellectual Property Amendments— Notice File No. Z2012-0921-01 . ........ ... ..., 1471

TITLE 24. BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION/DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT
Access Compliance Provisions — Incorporate and/or Align With 2010 ADA Sandards

—Notice FiIle NO. Z2012-0025-02 . . .. ..ottt 1474
TITLE28. DEPARTMENT OF MANAGED HEALTH CARE
Pervasive Development Disorder and Autism Coverage — Notice File No. Z2012-0925-05 .................. 1477

GENERAL PUBLIC INTEREST
DEPARTMENT OF FOOD AND AGRICULTURE

Notice Concerning Change of Hearing Date Regarding Shell Egg Food Safety ............. .. ...t 1489
FISH AND GAME COMMISSION
Notice of Receipt of Petition Concerning Listing the Northern Spotted Owl as an Endangered Species . ......... 1490

(Continued on next page)

Time-
Dated
Material



DISAPPROVAL DECISION
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICESAUTHORITY

ParamMEdIC . . o 1490
SUMMARY OF REGULATORY ACTIONS

Regulations filed with the Secretary of State . . .. ... ..o 1491
Sections Filed, May 2, 2012 to September 26, 2012 . . . ... ..ot 1493

The California Regulatory Notice Register is an official state publication of the Office of Administrative Law containing
notices of proposed regulatory actions by state regulatory agencies to adopt, amend or repeal regulations contained in the
California Code of Regulations. The effective period of a notice of proposed regulatory action by a state agency in the
California Regulatory Notice Register shall not exceed one year [ Government Code § 11346.4(b)]. It is suggested, therefore,
that issues of the California Regulatory Notice Register be retained for a minimum of 18 months.

CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER (USPS002-931), (ISSN 1041-2654) is published weekly by the Office
of Administrative Law, 300 Capitol Mall, Suite 1250, Sacramento, CA 95814-4339. The Register is printed by Barclays, a
subsidiary of West, a Thomson Reuters Business, and is offered by subscription for $205.00 (annual price). To order or make
changes to current subscriptions, please call (800) 888-3600. “Periodicals Postage Paid in Saint Paul, MN.” POSTMASTER:
Send address changesto the: CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER, Barclays, asubsidiary of West, a Thomson
Reuters Business, P.O. Box 2006, San Francisco, CA 94126. The Register can also be accessed at http://www.oal.ca.gov.



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

PROPOSED ACTION ON
REGULATIONS

Information contained in this document is
published as received from agenciesand is
not edited by Thomson Reuters.

TITLE 14. BOARD OF FORESTRY AND
FIRE PROTECTION

“ State Responsibility Area Fire Prevention
Benefit Fee, 2012”
Title 14 of the California Code of Regulation
(14 CCR), Chapter 13

Adopt:

8 1665.1.
8§ 1665.2.
§ 1665.3.

Authority.

Definitions.

Determination of EligibleHabitable
Structure.

Imposition of theBenefit Fee.

Request for Review and Refunds.

FeeStructure.

FeeExemptions.

Grant Program.

§ 1665.4.
§ 1665.5.
§ 1665.6.
§ 1665.7.
§1665.8.

The Cdlifornia State Board of Forestry and Fire
Protection (Board) is promulgating a regulation to
make permanent the emergency “ State Responsibility
Area Fire Prevention Benefit Fee” (SRA Fee) regula
tionsadopted pursuant to Assembly Bill X129, Chapter
8, Statutes 2011, Public Resources Code Section 4210,
et seq. The proposed regulations will replace the emer-
gency regulationsadopted and readopted consecutively
by the Board, and are necessary for continued imple-
mentation of the SRA Feeprogram.

PUBLIC HEARING

The Board will hold a public hearing on Wednesday,
December 5, 2012, starting at 8:00 am., at the Re-
sources Building Auditorium, 18t Floor, 1416 Ninth
Street, Sacramento, California. At the hearing, any per-
son may present statements or arguments, orally or in
writing, relevant to the proposed action described inthe
Informative Digest. The Board requests, but does not
require, that persons who make oral comments at the
hearing al so submit asummary of their statements. Ad-
ditionally, pursuant to Government Code § 11125.1,

any information presented to the Board during the open
hearing in connection with a matter subject to discus-
sion or consideration becomes part of the public record.
Such information shall be retained by the Board and
shall bemadeavailableuponrequest.

WRITTEN COMMENT PERIOD

Any person, or authorized representative, may sub-
mit written comments relevant to the proposed regula-
tory action to the Board. The written comment period
endsat 5:00 p.m., on Tuesday, November 20, 2012. The
Board will consider only written comments received at
the Board office by that time and any written comments
accompanying oral comments made at the public hear-
ing. The Board requests, but does not require, that per-
sons who submit written comments to the Board refer-
ence thetitle of the rulemaking proposal in their com-
mentstofacilitatereview.

Written commentsshall be submitted tothefollowing
address:

Board of Forestry and Fire Protection
Attn: Eric Huff
RegulationsCoordinator

P.O. Box 944246

Sacramento, CA 94244-2460

Written comments can also be hand delivered to the
contact person listed in this notice at the following
address:

Board of Forestry and FireProtection
Room 1506-14

1416 9th Street

Sacramento, CA

Written comments may also be sent to the Board via
facsimileat thefollowing phonenumber:

(916) 653-0989

Written comments may also be delivered via e-mail
at thefollowing address:

board.public.comments@fire.ca.gov

AUTHORITY AND REFERENCE

Authority cited: Public Resources Code Sections
4210, et seg. Reference: Public Resources Code Sec-
tions4003, 4102,4111, 4114, and 4125.

INFORMATIVE DIGEST/POLICY STATEMENT
OVERVIEW

TheBoardisauthorized pursuant to Public Resources
Code Section 4210, et seq. adopted by the State L egisla-

1453



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

tureas Assembly Bill 29 of the First Extraordinary Ses-
sionin 2011 (AB X1 29). AB X1 29 was authored by
Assemblyman Blumenfield and sought to create afee
for Statefire prevention services. According to the bill,
this fee was to be exclusively charged to individual
owners of structures in areas designated by the State
Board of Forestry and Fire Protection as State Respon-
sibility Area(SRA) for fireprotection. Therationalefor
thisexclusivefeefor services, asspecifiedinthebill, is
that owners of structuresin the SRA receive a“dispro-
portionately larger benefit” from State fire prevention
activities than the general citizenry (see Public Re-
sources Code Section 4210(d)). As the Legidature
found that structures within the SRA may pose an in-
creased risk of fireignition and increased potential for
fire—related damage to the natural resources of the
State, it was deemed appropriate to create a fee—based
funding mechanism to support State fire prevention ef-
fortsinthe SRA.

OnJune 15, 2011, theCaliforniaState Senateand As-
sembly approved the bill with language specifying that
the Board’'s adoption of emergency regulations,
“. .. shall be deemed an emergency and necessary for
the immediate preservation of the public peace, health,
and safety, or general welfare.” OnJuly 7, 2011, Gover-
nor Edmund G. Brown, Jr. signed ABX1 29 into law
and it was filed with the Secretary of State on the fol-
lowing day.

The statute being implemented, interpreted, and
made specificisChapter 741/Statutes 2011 adding Pub-
lic Resources Code Sections 4210-4228. Pursuant to
the authority provided by the enacted statute, the Board
of Forestry and Fire Protection (BOF) proposes to add
Chapter 13to Title 14 of the CaliforniaCode of Regula-
tions. Within new Chapter 13, the Board proposes to
add Sections 1665.1-1665.8 in accordance with the
provisions of the statute. In addition to the newly en-
acted statute, references utilized in the devel opment of
the proposed regulation include Sections 4003, 4102,
4111, 4114, and 4125 of the Public Resources Code.

Asdiscussed above, theregulationisintended to pro-
vide funding for statewide fire prevention activitiesin
areas designated as SRA. Absent this funding source,
the California Department of Forestry and Fire Protec-
tionwould be unableto deliver the prevention programs
that are crucia elements of the “2010 Strategic Fire
Plan for California.” Though the proposed regulation
doesnot itself promotefireprevention activities, it does
providethefinancial foundationfor such activities. The
fire prevention actions and activities funded by SRA
fees lead to improved protection of public health and
safety, and firefighter safety. Wherethisfire prevention
work includes hazardous fuels treatment or creation of
strategicfirebreaks, the potential for adverseimpactsto
theenvironment may also bereduced.

As the regulation is entirely focused on funding of
fire prevention activities, it will have no effect upon the
prevention of discrimination, the promotion of fairness
or social equity, or transparency in business and
government.

The proposed regulationisconsistent and compatible
with existing regulations, as it is limited in scope and
application to the collection and disbursement of afee
for service.

DISCLOSURES REGARDING THE
PROPOSED ACTION

e The results of the economic impact assessment
prepared pursuant to GC 11346.5(a)(10) for this
proposed regulation indicate that it will have a
direct economic effect upon owners of habitable
structures|located within areas designated as State
Responsibility Area (SRA) for fire protection.
Owners of habitable structures within SRA will
pay up to one-hundred fifty dollars ($150.00) per
structure annualy from which statewide fire
prevention activitieswill befunded.

Resultsof Economicl mpact Analysis

e  Adoption of these regulations will not: (1) create
or eliminatejobswithin California; (2) create new
businesses or eliminate existing businesseswithin
Cdifornia; or (3) affect the expansion of
businesses currently doing business within
Cdifornia.

The proposed regulation is expected to affect the
health and welfare of Californiaresidentslivingin
areas designated as SRA through the consistent
funding of fire prevention activities. Fire
prevention activities could result in benefits to
worker safety and the state’s environment through
creation of morefire—resilient |andscapes.

e  Significant adverse economicimpactson business
including the ability of California business to
compete with businessin other states: The Board
of Forestry finds that the adoption of these
regulations will not have a significant adverse
economic impact on small businesses. The total
number of commercial, industrial, or office
structures estimated to be eligiblefor the SRA Fee
isless than 22,000 statewide. Though it could be
argued that the addition of another expensein the
form of the SRA Fee could be cumulatively
harmful to a small business when combined with
other operating expenses, this would likely only
occur where businesses were already operating
with razor thin profit margins. In comparison to
many other Western states, the addition of SRA
fees would more closely approximate

1454



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

arrangements in those states where landowners
contribute to fire protection budgets via fees or
other methods. There should be no difference in
the ability of businessesin SRA to compete with
other states.

e  Cost impacts on representative private persons or
businesses: There will be an impact of up to one
hundred—fifty dollars ($150.00) per habitable
structure upon individual ownersof every eligible
structure.  Property owners with  multiple
structures could face multiple billings of one
hundred—fifty dollars ($150.00). The total fees
collected will be dependent upon the total number
of eligiblestructures.

e  Effect onsmall business: theBoard of Forestry and
Fire Protection has determined that this proposed
regulation will not have a significant effect upon
small business.

e Mandate on local agencies and school districts:
None.

e Costs or savings to any State agency: The
combined annua administrative costs of the fee
collection program incurred by the Board and
Department of Forestry & Fire Protection are
estimated to be amaximum of 7.5 million dollars.
The annual administrative costs of the fee
collection program incurred by the State Board of
Equalization are estimated to beamaximum of 6.5
milliondollars.

e Cost to any local agency or school district which
must be reimbursed in accordance with the
applicable Government Code (GC) sections
commencingwithGC 8§ 17500: None.

e  Other non—discretionary cost or savings imposed
upon local agencies: If local service districts that
provide fire protection cannot obtain voter
approval for increased property tax assessments
dueto the state’simposition of the SRA Fee, those
districts may be compelled to reduce operating
coststhrough reductionsinlevel of service.

e Cost or savings in federa funding to the State:
None.

e  Significant effect on housing costs: None.

e The proposed rules do not conflict with, or
duplicate Federal regulations.

BUSINESS REPORTING REQUIREMENT

The regulation does not require areport, which shall
apply tobusinesses.

CONSIDERATION OF ALTERNATIVES

In accordance  with  Government Code
§ 11346.5(8)(13), the Board must determinethat norea-
sonable alternative it considers or that has otherwise
beenidentified and brought to the attention of the Board
would be more effectivein carrying out the purpose for
which the action is proposed or would be as effective
and less burdensome to affected private persons than
the proposed action, or would be more cost—effectiveto
affected private personsand equally effectiveinimple-
menting thestatutory policy or other provision of law.

CONTACT PERSON

Requestsfor copiesof the proposed text of theregula-
tions, the I nitial Satement of Reasons, modified text of
the regulations and any questions regarding the sub-
stanceof the proposed action may bedirectedto:

Board of Forestry and Fire Protection
Attn: Eric Huff
RegulationsCoordinator

P.O. Box 944246

Sacramento, CA 94244-2460
Telephone: (916) 616-8643

Thedesignated backup personintheevent Mr. Huff is
not available is Mr. George Gentry, Executive Officer
of the CaliforniaBoard of Forestry and Fire Protection,
at the above address. Mr. Gentry may be reached by
phoneat 916-653-8007.

AVAILABILITY OF STATEMENT OF REASONS
AND TEXT OF PROPOSED REGULATIONS

The Board has prepared an Initial Satement of Rea-
sons providing an explanation of the purpose, back-
ground, and justification for the proposed regulations.
The statement is available from the contact person on
request. When the Final Statement of Reasons has been
prepared, the statement will be available from the con-
tact persononrequest.

A copy of theexpresstermsof the proposed action us-
ing UNDERLINE toindicatean additionto the Califor-
niaCodeof Regulationsand SFRIKETHROUGH toin-
dicate adeletion isalso available from the contact per-
sonnamedinthisnotice.

The Board will have the entire rulemaking file, in-
cluding al information considered as a basis for this
proposed regul ation, availablefor publicinspectionand
copying throughout the rulemaking processat its office
at the above address. All of the above referenced in-
formationisalsoavailableontheBoardweb siteat:

http://www.fire.ca.gov/BOF/board/board_
proposed_rule packages.html

1455



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

AVAILABILITY OF CHANGED OR
MODIFIED TEXT

After holding the hearing and considering all timely
and relevant comments received, the Board may adopt
the proposed regulations substantially as described in
thisnotice. If the Board makes modificationswhich are
sufficiently related to the originaly proposed text, it
will make the modified text — with the changesclearly
indicated — available to the public for at least 15 days
before the Board adoptsthe regulations asrevised. No-
tice of the comment period on changed regulations, and
thefull text asmodified, will be sentto any personwho:
a) tedtifiedatthehearings,

b) submitted comments during the public comment
period, including written and oral comments
received at the publichearing, or

c) requested notification of the availability of such
changes from the Board of Forestry and Fire
Protection.

Requestsfor copiesof themodified text of theregula-
tionsmay be directed to the contact person listed in this
notice. The Board will accept written comments on the
modified regulationsfor 15 daysafter the date on which
they aremadeavailable.

TITLE 14. STATE MINING AND
GEOLOGY BOARD

PROPOSED AMENDED REGULATIONSFOR
DESIGNATION OF MINERAL LANDS
INTHE PALM SPRINGS
PRODUCTION-CONSUMPTION REGION,
RIVERSIDE COUNTY

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the State Mining and
Geology Board (SMGB) proposes to amend regula-
tions described below after considering all comments
and recommendationsregarding the proposed action.

REGULATORY ACTION

The SMGB has adopted, by regulation set forth in
CCR Section 3550 the designation of certain mineral
resource sectors within geographical areas to be of re-
gional significance. Designation is the formal recogni-
tion by the SMGB of lands containing mineral re-
sources of regional or statewide economic significance
that are needed to meet the demands of the future. The
SMGB proposes to present new proposed regulations
whichwould amend Section 3550.15to Title 14, Article
2, of the California Code of Regulations (CCR), and
provide a description of the locations of minera re-
sources areas designated to be of statewide signifi-

cance, and areas where designation will be terminated,
within the Palm Springs Production—Consumption
(P—C) Region, San Bernardino County.

PREVIOUS PUBLIC HEARINGS

The State Geologist recommended to the SMGB 1)
several candidates, or areas, which meet or exceed the
SMGB’sthreshold economicval ue, thus, each areamay
be considered for designation as an area of regional or
statewide significance by the SMGB, and 2) severa
candidates, or areas, wherethe SM GB’sinvolvement is
no longer required. Thereclassified areasareidentified
as Sector K. Candidate Sector K has eight sub—sectors
(K—1 through K-38) that border the existing Sector G on
the northwestern, northern, and eastern sides, and two
areasin the eastern Palm Springs P-C Region being re-
classified asMRZ—-2b for PCC—grade aggregate. These
areasareidentified as Candidate Sector | and Candidate
Sector J(sub—sectorsJ-1through J-6).

In regards to termination of lands previously desig-
nated, five areas, in Sectors A—3, B-2, B—3, and B-5in
the San Gorgonio Pass, are sites where large, high—
value wind-driven electrical generators have been
constructed. Onearea, Sector Cin LittleMorongo Can-
yon near Desert Hot Springs, is the site of recently
constructed urban devel opment and flood control infra-
structure. Thesedesignated sitesarelocated inthewest-
ern part of the Palm Springs P-C Region and will beter-
minated. The recommendations were accepted by the
SMGB on October 14, 2010.

The 60—day public comment period, pursuant to PRC
Section 2762(d)(2), commenced on February 6, 2009,
and ended on April 7, 2009. In addition, pursuant to
PRC Section 2793, apublic hearing washeld on March
11, 2009, in Palm Springs. The hearing facility wasbar-
rier freein accordance with the Americanswith Disabi-
litiesAct. At the hearing, an opportunity for any person
to present statements or arguments orally or in writing
relevant to the proposed action described in the Infor-
mative Digest, was provided. The SMGB requested,
but did not require, that persons who made oral com-
ments at the hearing also submit awritten copy of their
testimony. Written comments were received from the
Coachella Valey Mountains Conservancy (CVMC),
and the Friends of the Desert Mountains in regards to
designation of new areas. No comments were received
pertaining to termination of designated areas.

The CVMC in correspondence dated March 10,
20009, offered several commentsasfollows:

Comment No. 1: Sector | isdescribed asincluding
“that part of Thermal canyon wash within the Palm
Springs P-C Region. It is south of Interstate High-
way 10....”. Thermal Canyon wash isan impor tant
wildlife movement corridor linking the Mecca Hills

1456



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

Wilderness and Joshua Tree National Park. The

wildlifehabitat and other conser vation values. Simi-

Friendshasbeen acquiringlandin adjacent toTher -
mal Canyon with a Proposition 84 grant from the
Conservancy to protect thiscrucial biological corri-
dor. Thermal Canyon isalso targeted for conserva-
tion within the NCCP Reser ve System. Intent to pur-
chase land does not prevent or conflict with designa-
tion. A surface mineistemporary and with reclamation
the mine site is returned to open space, or some other
land use determined by thelocal |ead agency. Designa-
tion does not prevent subsequent conservation of these
areas, or consideration of some other land use incom-
patiblewith mining.

Comment No. 2: Sector J—1(2,633acres). Thisisa

lar to theresponseto Comment No. 2, and being consis-
tent with previous considerations, it is recommended
that approximately 103 acres within Sector J-2 not be
designated.

Comment No. 4: Sector J -3 (1,135 acres). A por-
tion of this sector is part of the 8,881 acres refer-
enced aboveand ismanaged in part by the Bur eau of
Land Management (BLM) and in part by State
Parks. BLM used federal funds specifically to pro-
tect the habitat values of the property aspart of the
Coachella Valley Fringe-toed Lizard Area of Criti-
cal Environmental Concern. State Par ksused Prop-
osition 40 bond fundsapproved by thevoter sspecifi-

portion of the8,881 acresacquired in 2004 by apart-

cally for the purpose of protecting wildlife habitat

nership of conservation entities to conserve the

and other conservation values. Additional portions

lands in perpetuity as part of the NCCP Reserve

of this sector were acquired in the 1980s by ELM

System. The lands are currently managed by the

with federal fundsaspart of theestablishment of the

California Department of Parks and Recreation

Coachella Valley Fringe-toed Lizard Area of Criti-

(“ State Parks’), the Califor nia Department of Fish

cal Environmental Concern, which is part of the

and Game (“ CDFG") and the Friends of the Desert

Mountains (“ Friends”). These lands were acquired

primarily or entirely with Proposition 40 bond

funds approved by the voters specifically for the
pur poseof protectingwildlifehabitat and other con-
servation values. The SMGB has previously not con-
sidered designation of mineral lands when such land
has been purchased for the sole purpose of protecting
wildlife habitat and other conservation values. When
the SMGB in 1989 considered designation within the

Palm—Springs P-C Region, the SMGB excluded land

from designated after public input for the following

reasons:

e Within a Habitat Conservation Plan (i.e,
endangered species such as fringed—toed lizard
habitat);

e Sectorsidentified asasensitiveresourcearea;

e Highwindsandsceniccorridors;

e  Existing wind turbines and gas lines, high winds,
visual concerns, and the potential for high water;
and

e Floodplain Reserve because of the existence of
endangered species.

Being consistent with previous considerations, it is
recommended that approximately 2,633 acres within
Sector J-1 not bedesignated.

Comment No. 3: Sector J -2 (103 acres). Thisisa

Coachella Valley Fringe-toed Lizard Preserve es-
tablished pursuant toaHabitat conservation Planto
satisfy the federal Endangered Species Act. Similar
totheresponseto Comment No. 2, and being consi stent
with previous considerations, it is recommended that
approximately 1,135 acres within Sector J-3 not be
designated.

Comment No. 5: Sector K- (112 acres). The por-
tion of thisthat isin Section 28 is owned by State
Parks and iswithin the Indio Hills unit of the State
Park system. State Parks is a Per mittee under the
NCCP and is obligated to manage the land for its
habitat conservation valuesin perpetuity. Similar to
the response to Comment No. 2, and being consistent
with previous considerations, it is recommended that
approximately 52 acres within Sector K—1 not be
designated.

Comment No. 6: Sector K—4 (136 acres). Thepor -
tion of thisthat isin Section 27 is owned by either
State Parks and iswithin the Indio Hills unit of the
StatePark system and theNCCP Reserve System, or
by the Friendsof the Desert M ountains. State Parks
is a Permittee under the NCCP and is obligated to
manage the land for its habitat conservation values
in per petuity. The Friendsis a nonprofit conserva-
tion organization that holdsland for the purpose of
conserving the resource values on the land. The
Friends landisalsowiththeNCCP Reserve System.

portion of the8,881 acresacquiredin 2004 by apart-
nership of conservation entities to conserve the
lands in perpetuity as part of the NCCP Reserve
System. The lands are currently managed by State
Parks. These lands were acquired primarily or en-
tirely with Proposition 40 bond funds approved by
the voters specifically for the purpose of protecting

Similar to the response to Comment No. 2, and being
consistent with previous considerations, it is recom-
mended that approximately 4 acres within Sector K—4
not bedesignated.

FDM in correspondence dated March 11, 2009, ex-
pressed support of the comment letter provided by the
CVMC dated March 10, 2009, noting that FDM owns

1457



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

considerable acreage within potential designated areas,
and expressed no interest of any of their lands being
designated for possiblemineral extraction.

WRITTEN COMMENT PERIOD

Any interested person, or hisor her authorized repre-
sentative, may submit written commentsrelevant tothe
proposed regulatory action to the SMGB. Comments
may aso be submitted by facsimile (FAX) at (916)
445-0738 or by e-mail to stephen.testa@conservation.
ca.gov. The45—-day comment period will commenceon
October 5, 2012, and closes at 5:00 p.m. on November
19, 2012. The SMGB will consider only comments re-
ceived at the SMGB officeby that time. No public hear-
ing is scheduled, but any person can request a public
hearing no later than 15 days before the close of the
written comment period.

AUTHORITY AND REFERENCE

The SMGB proposes to adopt a regulation that
amends Section 3350.15 to Article 2 of the California
Code of Regulations, Title 14, Division 2, Chapter 8,
Subchapter 1, pursuant to its authority granted in PRC
Sections 2790 and 2207 (Reference PRC Section 2726,
2761-2763,2790-2791, and 2793).

INFORMATIVE DIGEST

The SMGB has adopted, by regulation set forth in
CCR Section 3550 the designation of certain mineral
resource sectors within geographical areas to be of re-
gional significance. Designation is the formal recogni-
tion by the SMGB of lands containing mineral re-
sources of regional or statewide economic significance
that areneeded to meet thedemandsof thefuture.

In 1985, the CaliforniaDivision of Minesand Geolo-
gy (CDMG; now CGS) published Special Report 159
(SR 159) — Mineral Land Classification: Aggregate
Materials in the Palm Springs Production—
Consumption Region. In response to this classification
report, the SMGB, in 1989, designated construction ag-
gregate resource areas of regional significance in the
Palm Springs P-C Region as presented in the report
titled “ SMARA Designation Report No. 10 —Designa-
tion of Regionally Sgnificant Construction Aggregate
Resources in the Palm Springs Production—Consump-
tion Region”. At its December 13, 2007, regular busi-
ness meeting, the SMGB accepted California Geol ogi-
cal Survey (CGS) Special Report 198 which updatedin-
formation on Portland cement concrete—grade (PCC)
aggregate in the Palm Springs Production—

Consumption (P—C) Region previously presentedin SR

159.

The updated mineral classification report prepared
by CGS, SR 198, presented thefollowing conclusions:

e As of January 2006, eleven mines, operated by
seven different mining companies, were
producing PCC—grade aggregate in the Palm
Springs P-C Region. In 1985, there were eight
mines operated by five mining companies. In
addition to PCC aggregates, these mines also
produced a full range of lower aggregate grades
for such productsasasphaltic concreteand base.

e The anticipated consumption of aggregate in the
Palm Springs P-C Region for the next 50 years
(through the year 2056) is estimated to be 307
million tons, of which 45 percent, or 138 million
tons, must be PCC quality. Thisis nearly double
the 50—year consumption estimate made in SR
159.

e Since 1985, permitted PCC—grade aggregate
reserves have increased from 67 million tons to
167 million tons, extending the projected
depletiondatefrom2012to 2038.

e Approximately 10 percent, or 923@ acres of the
9,094 acres of lands designated by the SMGB in
1989, has been lost to land usesincompatible with
mining.

e An additional 6,638 acres of land containing an
estimated 472 million tons of PCC—grade
aggregate resources have been identified in the
Palm SpringsP-C Region.

Thepublication of Special Report 159, and itsupdate,
Special Report 198, accomplish part one of the two—
part Classification—Designation process. Part two of
the two—step process, designation, isthe formal recog-
nition by the SMGB of lands containing mineral re-
sources of regional or statewide economic significance
needed to meet the demands of the future. In the years
sincetheoriginal publication of Special Report 159, ter-
mination of designation for certain areas where the di-
rect involvement of the SMGB is no longer required
haveal so beenidentified.

The State Geol ogist hasrecommended several candi-
dates, or areas, which meet or exceed the SMGB’s
threshold economic value, thus, each areamay be con-
sidered for designation as an area of regional or state-
wide significance by the SMGB. These areas include
eight areas which have been reclassified as MRZ—2a,
and eight areasthat havebeenreclassified asM RZ—2b.

The State Geol ogi st al so recommended five areasfor
termination of designation. Six areas (in five Sectors)
areidentified as potential candidates for termination of
designation status due to high—value incompatible land
use developments. Five areas, in Sectors A-3, B-2,

1458



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

B—3, and B-5 in the San Gorgonio Pass, are siteswhere
large, high-value wind-driven electrical generators
have been constructed. Onearea, Sector CinLittleMo-
rongo Canyon near Desert Hot Springs, isthe site of re-
cently constructed urban development and flood con-
trol infrastructure. These sites, located in the western
part of the Palm Springs P-C Region, are shown on
Plate 1 (Western Area). In addition to the areas de-
scribed below, areasin Sectors E—1, E—2, and F are now
underlain by a utility corridor carrying fiber optic
cables. These areas amount to 100 acres containing 27
million tons of aggregate. Because these cables may be
relocatable, allowing for the mining of the underlying
aggregate, the State Geologist did not recommend ter-
mination of designation statusfor these utility corridors
at thistime.

POLICY STATEMENT OVERVIEW

The proposed regulations would allow consideration
of new information obtai ned sincethe publication of the
1985 Mineral Land Classification study. The proposed
amended regulations reflect information provided in
CGS Special Report 159 which identified 28.2 square
milesof sectorized landsavailableto meet futureaggre-
gate needs, and approximately 67 million tons of PCC—
grade aggregate resources. A reevaluation and update
as presented in CGS Special Report 198 identified an
additional 6,638 acres of land containing an estimated
472 tons of PCC—grade aggregate resources. The re-
classified areas are identified as Sector K. Candidate
Sector K has eight sub—sectors (K-1 through K-8) that
border the existing Sector G onthenorthwestern, north-
ern, and eastern sides, and two areasin the eastern Palm
Springs P-C Region being reclassified as MRZ—2b for
PCC—grade aggregate. These areas are identified as
Candidate Sector | and Candidate Sector J (sub—sectors
J-1through J-6).

Each Sector that may be considered for designation
as an area of regional or statewide significance by the
SMGB pursuant to Article 6, Section 2790 et seq.
(SMARA), meets or exceeds the threshold value as es-
tablished by the SMGB. This proposed regulation is
necessary in order for the State to meet its aggregate
availability and sustainability needs.

The proposed regulatory language is consistent and
compatiblewith existing state regulations. The specific
benefits anticipated by the proposed amendment pro-
vides nonmonetary benefits to the environment by
avoiding species conservation areas and habitat sensi-
tive areas, while contributing to effortsto reduce green-
house gas emissions, and does not conflict with the
protection of public health and safety, worker safety, the
prevention of discrimination, the promotion of fairness
or social equity, and theincreasein openness and trans-

parency in business and government, among other
things.

CEQA COMPLIANCE

The SMGB has determined that this rulemaking ac-
tionisnot aproject asdefined inthe CaliforniaEnviron-
mental Quality Act (CEQA) and isexempt fromthere-
quirements of CEQA, Title 14, CCR, Section
15061(b)(3).

DISCLOSURES REGARDING THE
PROPOSED ACTION

The SMGB'’s Executive Officer hasmadethefollow-
ing preliminary determinations:

M andate on local agenciesand school districts:
The adoption of this amended regulation does not
impose any new mandates on local agenciesor on
local school districts.
Costs or savings to any State agency: The
proposed amended regul ation imposes no savings
or additional expensesto stateagencies.
Cost toany local agency or school district which
must _be reimbursed in_accordance with
Government Code Sections 17500 through
17630: The proposed amended regulation does
not impose any additional cost obligationsonlocal
agenciesor onlocal school districts.
Other non-discretionary costs or _savings
imposed upon local agencies. No other
non—discretionary costs or savings to local
agencies are imposed by the proposed amended
regulation.
Cost or savingsin Federal fundingtothe State:
Thereareno costsor savingsin Federal funding to
the State.
Significant statewide adver se economicimpact
directly affecting businessincluding the ability
of California businesses to compete with
businessesin other states: No statewide adverse
impacts to California businesses result from the
adoption of this proposed amended regulatory
language.
Potential cost impact on private persons or
directly affected businesses. The imposition of
the proposed amended language on a directly
affected local mining operation will have a
positive cost impact to that operation by the
recognition of designated mineral land of regional
significance which in some circumstances may
reducetheamount of time, thuscost, inacquiringa
permit to mine from itslead agency. Furthermore,
termination of formally designated areas would
not haveany costimpact.

1459



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

Results of Economic Impact Analysis. The
adoption of thisamended regul ationwill not:

e  Createnor eliminatejobswithin California;

e  Create new nor eliminate existing businesses
within Californig;

e  Expand businesses currently doing business
inCalifornia

The adoption of this amended regulation will,
however, benefit the health and welfare of
Cdlifornia residents and the state’s environment
by avoiding species conservation and habitat
sensitiveareas, aswell asreducing greenhousegas
emissionsrelatedtotransportation.

Significant effect on housing costs. Theadoption
of thisamended regul ation will have no significant
effect on housing costs, but may reduce such costs
by providing a source of PCC—grade aggregate
closer tousersand market areas.

Effects on small businesses: The imposition of
the proposed amendment will have no cost impact
on small businesses. The SMGB is not aware of
any cost impacts that a representative private
person or business would necessarily incur in
reasonable compliance with the proposed action.
There are no costs related or associated with the
proposed designation of minera lands. Such
considerations require a lead agency to consider
the regiona significance of minera lands
designated by the SMGB when making land use
decisions, but do not impose any fees or costs to
small businessesaspart of that consideration.

CONSIDERATION OF ALTERNATIVES

The SMGB must determine that no reasonable alter-
nativethat it considersor that hasotherwisebeenidenti-
fied and brought to the attention of the SMGB would be
more effectivein carrying out the purposefor which the
action is proposed, or would be as effective and less
burdensome to affected private persons than the pro-
posed action, or would be more cost—effective to af-
fected private personsand equally effectiveinthe statu-
tory policy or other provision of law. The SMGB’s
Executive Officer has not identified any adverse im-
pactsresulting fromthe proposed regul ation.

No alternatives have been considered by the SMGB
at thistime that would be more effectivein carrying out
the purposefor whichtheregulatory actionisproposed,
nor have any other alternatives been proposed that
would be as effective and less burdensome to affected
private persons, lead agencies, or small businesses.

CONFLICT WITH FEDERAL REGULATIONS

Thisregulation change does not duplicate or conflict
with existing Federal statutes or regulations. Also, by
Memorandum of Understanding with the Federal Bu-
reau of Land Management, theU. S. Forest Service, the
Department of Conservation, and the SMGB, SMARA
and federa law are coordinated to eliminate
duplication.

GENERAL PURPOSE AND
CONDITION ADDRESSED

Article 6 of the Surface Mining and Reclamation Act
of 1975 (SMARA), commencing with PRC Section
2790, provides for the SMGB, based upon mineral in-
formation from the State Geol ogist pursuant to subdivi-
sion (c) of PRC Section 2761, to adopt in regulation
specific geographic areas of the state as areas of state-
wide or regional mineral resource significance and
specify theboundariesof thoseareas.

At its December 13, 2007, regular business meeting,
the SMGB accepted California Geological Survey
(CGS) Special Report 198 which updated information
previously presented in a classification report on Port-
land cement concrete—grade (PCC) aggregate in the
Palm Springs Production—Consumption (P-C) Region
completed in 1985. The previous report was published
by the California Divison of Mines and Geology
(CDMG; now CGS) as Specia Report 159 (SR 159) —
Mineral Land Classification: Aggregate Materialsin
the Palm Springs Production—Consumption Region.
The State Geologist's recommendations for designa-
tion, and termination of designation, of select mineral
resource landsin the Palm Springs P-C Region, River-
side County, were accepted by the SMGB’sMineral and
Geologic Resources Committee at its regular business
meeting held on April 10, 2008. The 60—day public
comment period commenced on February 6, 2009, and
ended on April 7, 2009. In addition, pursuant to PRC
Section 2793, a public hearing was held on March 11,
2009, in Palm Springs. During such hearing, comments
were received and responses prepared. Written com-
ments were received from the Coachella Valley Moun-
tains Conservancy (CVMC), and the Friends of the
Desert Mountains, and addressed. At its October 14,
2010, regular business meeting, the SMGB accepted
the proposed regulation with modification in consider-
ation of public commentsreceived.

SPECIFIC PURPOSE

The proposed amended regulation Section 3550.15,
Article 2 CCR, isintended to clarify and make specific
those mineral lands that are to be designated by the

1460



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

SMGB as having regional significance within the Ba-
kersfield P-C Region. These regulations are contained
under Article 2, titled Areas Designated to be of Re-
gional Significance.

The proposed amended regulations reflect informa-
tion provided in CGS Special Report 159 identified
28.2 square miles of sectorized lands avail able to meet
future aggregate needs, and approximately 67 million
tonsof PCC—grade aggregate resources. A reevaluation
and update as presented in CGS Specia Report 198
identified an additional 6,638 acres of land containing
an estimated 472 tons of PCC—grade aggregate re-
sources. The reclassified areas are identified as Sector
K. Candidate Sector K has eight sub—sectors (K-1
through K-8) that border the existing Sector G on the
northwestern, northern, and eastern sides, and two areas
in the eastern Palm Springs P-C Region being reclassi-
fiedasMRZ—-2b for PCC—grade aggregate. These areas
areidentified as Candidate Sector | and Candidate Sec-
tor J(sub—sectors J-1through J-6).

The State Geol ogi st al so recommended five areasfor
termination of designation in the western Palm Springs
P-C Region. Six areas (infive Sectors) areidentified as
potential candidates for termination of designation sta-
tus due to high—value incompatible land use develop-
ments. Fiveareas, in SectorsA—3, B—2, B—3,and B-5in
the San Gorgonio Pass, are sites where large, high—
value wind—driven electrical generators have been
constructed.

Proposed amended regulations, CCR Section
3550.15, indicates reference to two plates (maps).
Thesetwo platesformanintegral part of theregul ation.

STATEMENT OF NECESSITY

PRC Section 2790 providesthe SMGB the authority to
adopt regulations that establish state policy for the
designation of mineral lands of statewide or regional
significance, in accordance with Article 6
(commencing with Section 2790) of this chapter, and
pursuant to PRC Section 2761. PRC Section 2790,
statesthat after receipt of mineral information from the
State Geologist, the SMGB may by regulation adopted
after a public hearing designate specific geographic
areas of the state as areas of statewide or regional
significance and specify the boundaries thereof. Such
designation shall beincluded asapart of the state policy
and shall indicate the reason for which the particular
areadesignated is of significance to the state or region,
the adverse effects that might result from premature
devel opment of incompatibleland uses, the advantages
that might be achieved from extraction of the minerals
of the area, and the specific goal sand policiesto protect

against the premature incompatible devel opment of the
area. PRC Section 2791 also requiresthe SMGB to seek
the recommendations of concerned federal, state, and
local agencies, educational ingtitutions, civic and
public interest organi zations, and private organi zations
and individuals in the identification of areas of
statewide and regional significance. PRC Section 2793
allows the SMGB by regulation adopted after a public
hearing, to terminate, partially or wholly, the
designation of any area of statewide or regional
significance on afinding that the direct involvement of
theboardisnolonger required.

In 2006, the California Geological Survey (CGS) in
their statewide report titled “Map Sheet 52 (Updated
2006), Aggregate Availability in California” noted that
the Palm Springs P-C Region 50—-year demand for ag-
gregate was on the order of 295 million tons. Permitted
aggregate resources were on the order of 176 million
tons. The percentage of permitted aggregate resources,
as compared to the 50-year demand, was 60 percent,
significantly lower thanthe projected demand.

Special Report 159 “Mineral Land Classification:
Aggregate Materials in the Palm Sorings Production—
Consumption Region,” published by the California Di-
vision of Mines and Geology (CDMG; now CGS) in
1989, identified 28.2 square miles of sectorized lands
containing approximately 67 million tons of PCC—
grade aggregate resources available to meet future ag-
gregate needs. In review of the reevaluation and update
in Special Report 198 updated information on Portland
cement concrete—grade (PCC) aggregate in the Palm
Springs Production—Consumption (PC) Region pre-
viously presented in SR 159, the State Geologist has
recommended several candidates, or areas, which meet
or exceed the SMGB’s threshold economic value, and
each areamay be considered for designation as an area
of regional or statewide significanceby the SMGB, and
hasidentified an additional 6,638 acresof land contain-
ing an estimated 472 million tons of PCC—grade aggre-
gate resources in the Palm Springs P-C Region. These
areas include eight areas which have been reclassified
asMRZ-2a, and eight areas that have been reclassified
asMRZ-2b.

The State Geologist also recommended several can-
didatesfor termination of designation. Six areas(infive
Sectors) are identified as potential candidates for ter-
mination of designation status due to high—value in-
compatible land use developments. Five areas, in Sec-
torsA-3, B—2, B—3, and B-5 in the San Gorgonio Pass,
are sites where large, high—value wind—driven electri-
cal generators have been constructed. One area, Sector
CinLittleMorongo Canyon near Desert Hot Springs, is

1461



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

the site of recently constructed urban development and
flood control infrastructure.

IDENTIFICATION OF TECHNICAL/
THEORETICAL/EMPIRICAL STUDIES,
REPORTS, OR DOCUMENTS UPON WHICH
THE SMGB HAS RELIED

Designation is the formal recognition by the SMGB
of lands containing mineral resources of regiona or
statewide economic significance that are needed to
meet the demands of the future. In 1985, the California
Division of Mines and Geology (CDMG; now CGYS)
published Special Report 159 (SR 159) — Mineral
Land Classification: Aggregate Materials in the Palm
Sorings Production—Consumption Region. In response
to this classification report, the SMGB, in 1989, desig-
nated construction aggregate resource areas of regional
significance in the Palm Springs P-C Region as pres-
ented in the report titled “ SMARA Designation Report
No. 10 — Designation of Regionally Sgnificant
Construction Aggregate Resourcesin the Palm Sorings
Production—-Consumption Region”. At its December
13, 2007, regular business meeting, the SMGB ac-
cepted California Geological Survey (CGS) Specia
Report 198 which updated information on Portland ce-
ment concrete—grade (PCC) aggregate in the Palm
Springs Production—Consumption (P-C) Region pre-
viously presentedin SR 159.

The updated mineral classification report prepared
by CGS, SR 198, presented thefollowing conclusions:
As of January 2006, eleven mines, operated by
seven different mining companies, were
producing PCC—grade aggregate in the Palm
Springs P-C Region. In 1985, there were eight
mines operated by five mining companies. In
addition to PCC aggregates, these mines also
produced a full range of lower aggregate grades
for such productsasasphaltic concreteand base.

The anticipated consumption of aggregate in the
Palm Springs PC Region for the next 50 years
(through the year 2056) is estimated to be 307
million tons, of which 45 percent, or 138 million
tons, must be PCC quality. Thisis nearly double
the 50-year consumption estimate made in SR
159.

Since 1985, permitted PCC—grade aggregate
reserves have increased from 67 million tons to
167 million tons, extending the projected
depletiondatefrom2012to 2038.

Approximately 10 percent, or 923 acres of the
9,094 acres of lands designated by the SMGB in
1989, has been | ost to land usesincompatible with
mining.

1462

e An additional 6,638 acres of land containing an
estimated 472 million tons of PCC—grade
aggregate resources have been identified in the
Palm SpringsP-C Region.

The State Geol ogi st hasrecommended several candi-

dates, or areas, which meet or exceed the SMGB’s

threshold economic value, thus, each area may be con-
sidered for designation as an area of regional or state-
wide significance by the SMGB. These areas include
eight areas which have been reclassified as MRZ—2a,
and eight areasthat have been reclassified asMRZ—2b.

The State Geologist also recommended five areas for

termination of designation.

AVAILABILITY OF CHANGED OR
MODIFIED TEXT

After holding the hearing and considering al timely
and relevant commentsreceived, the SMGB may adopt
the proposed regulations substantially as described in
this notice. If the SMGB makes modifications which
aresufficiently related to the originally proposed text, it
will make the modified text (with changes clearly indi-
cated) availableto the public for at least 15 days before
the SMGB adopts the regulations as revised. Please
send requests for copies of any modified regulationsto
the attention of Mr. Stephen Testa at the address pro-
vided below. The SMGB will accept written comments
onthemodified regulationsfor 15 daysafter the dateon
whichthey aremadeavailable.

AVAILABILITY OF THE FINAL STATEMENT
OF REASONS

Uponitscompletion, copiesof the Final Statement of
Reasons may be obtained by contacting Mr. Stephen
Testaat theaddressprovided bel ow.

CONTACT PERSON

An interested person may request a copy of the pro-
posed amended regulation and the Initial Statement of
Reasons. Questions about the proposed regulation and
Initial Statement of Reasons can be directed to the
SMGB's office. All supplemental information, upon
which the regulation is based, is contained in the rule-
makingfile.

The rulemaking fileis available for inspection at the
SMGB Officeat 801 K Street, Suite 2015, Sacramento,
California, between 9:00 am. and 4:00 p.m., Monday
through Friday except during state holidays. Copies of
the proposed regulation and the Initial Statement of
Reasons may be requested by writing to the above ad-
dress, or viewed on the SMGB'’s Internet Web Site at:
http://www.conser vation.ca.gov/smgb.




CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

Inquiries concerning the substance of the proposed
amended regulation should bedirected to:

Mr. Stephen M. Testa, Executive Officer
StateMining and Geology Board

801K Street, Suite2015

Sacramento, California95814

Phone: (916) 322—-1082

Fax: (916) 4450738

Stephen. Testa@conservation.ca.gov

OR

Amy Scott, Executive Assistant
StateMiningand Geology Board
801K Street, Suite2015
Sacramento, CA 95814

Phone: (916) 322-1082

Fax: (916) 4450738
Amy.Scott@conservation.ca.gov

TITLE 14. STATE MINING AND
GEOLOGY BOARD

PROPOSED AMENDED REGULATIONSFOR
DESIGNATION OF MINERAL LANDS
IN THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY
PRODUCTION-CONSUMPTION REGION,
LOSANGELES COUNTY

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the State Mining and
Geology Board (SMGB) proposes to amend regula-
tions described below after considering all comments
and recommendationsregarding the proposed action.

REGULATORY ACTION

The SMGB has adopted, by regulation set forth in
CCR Section 3550 the designation of certain mineral
resource sectors within geographical areas to be of re-
gional significance. Designation isthe formal recogni-
tion by the SMGB of lands containing mineral re-
sources of regional or statewide economic significance
that are needed to meet the demands of the future. The
SMGB proposes to present hew proposed regulations
which would amend Section 3550.5to Title 14, Article
2, of the California Code of Regulations (CCR), and
provide a description of the locations of mineral re-
sources areas designated to be of statewide signifi-
cance, and areas where designation will be terminated,
within the San Gabriel Valey Production—
Consumption (P—C) Region, LosAngelesCounty.

PREVIOUS PUBLIC HEARINGS

The State Geologist recommended to the SMGB
1) severa candidates, or areas, which meet or exceed
the SMGB'’sthreshold economic value, thus, each area
may be considered for designation asan areaof regional
or statewide significance by the SMGB, and 2) several
candidates, or areas, wherethe SMGB’sinvolvementis
no longer required. Theupdated Mineral Land Classifi-
cation study identified an additional 281 acres of land
containing more than 311 million tons of PCC—grade
aggregatein areasprevioudly classified MRZ-3. These
areas were reclassified as MRZ-2 in the update. The
areas areidentified as Sectors J, K, L, and M are newly
identified aggregate resource sectorsthat werenot orig-
inally designated. Sector Jdelineates|and that has been
reclassified in OFR 91-14 to MRZ-2 from MRZ-3
(Miller, 1994). SectorsK, L, and M delineate landsthat
were classified MRZ—2 in SR 143 Part |V, but were not
includedin part of asector.

In regards to termination of lands previously desig-
nated, six sectorsareidentified for termination of desig-
nation. The six areas are identified as potential candi-
dates for termination of designation status due to high—
valueincompatibleland use devel opments. These areas
are situated within Sectors A (263 acres), B (12 acres),
C (42 acres), D (391 acres), E (422 acres) and | (104
acres), totaling 908 acres.

The 60—day public comment period commenced on
July 29, 2011, and ended on September 26, 2011. In
addition, pursuant to PRC Section 2793, a public hear-
ing was held on August 30, 2011, in the City of Irwin-
dale. During such public comment period and hearing,
no comments were received. The hearing facility was
barrier freein accordance with the Americanswith Dis-
abilitiesAct. At the hearing, an opportunity for any per-
sonto present statements or argumentsorally or inwrit-
ing relevant to the proposed action described in the In-
formative Digest, was provided. The SMGB requested,
but did not require, that persons who made oral com-
ments at the hearing also submit awritten copy of their
testimony.

WRITTEN COMMENT PERIOD

Any interested person, or hisor her authorized repre-
sentative, may submit written commentsrelevant to the
proposed regulatory action to the SMGB. Comments
may also be submitted by facsimile (FAX) at (916)
4450738 or by emal to stephen.testa@
conservation.ca.gov. The 45-day comment period will

commence on October 5, 2012, and closes at 5:00 p.m.
on November 19, 2012. The SMGB will consider only
commentsreceived at the SMGB officeby that time. No
public hearing is scheduled, but any person can request

1463



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

apublic hearing no later than 15 daysbeforethe close of
thewritten comment period.

AUTHORITY AND REFERENCE

The SMGB proposes to adopt a regulation that
amends Section 3350.5 to Article 2 of the California
Code of Regulations, Title 14, Division 2, Chapter 8,
Subchapter 1, pursuant to its authority granted in PRC
Sections 2790 and 2207 (Reference PRC Section 2726,
2761-2763,2790-2791, and 2793).

INFORMATIVE DIGEST

The SMGB has adopted, by regulation set forth in
CCR Section 3550 the designation of certain mineral
resource sectors within geographical areas to be of re-
gional significance. Designation is the formal recogni-
tion by the SMGB of lands containing mineral re-
sources of regional or statewide economic significance
that areneeded to meet thedemandsof thefuture.

In 1985, the Cadlifornia Division of Mines and
Geology (CDMG; now CGS) published Specia Report
159 (SR 159) — Mineral Land Classification: Aggre-
gate Materials in the San Gabriel Valley Production—
Consumption Region. In response to this classification
report, the SMGB, in 1989, designated construction ag-
gregate resource areas of regional significance in the
San Gabriel Valley P-C Region as presented in the re-
port titled “ SMARA Designation Report No. 10 —Des-
ignation of Regionally Sgnificant Construction Aggre-
gate Resources in the San Gabriel Valley Production—
Consumption Region”. AtitsDecember 13, 2007, regu-
lar business meeting, the SMGB accepted California
Geologica Survey (CGS) Special Report 198 which
updated information on Portland cement concrete-
grade (PCC) aggregate in the San Gabriel Valley Pro-
duction—Consumption (P-C) Region previously pres-
entedin SR 159.

The updated mineral classification report prepared
by CGS, SR 198, presented thefollowing conclusions:

e As of January 2006, eleven mines, operated by
seven different mining companies, were
producing PCC—grade aggregate in the San
Gabriel Valley P-C Region. In 1985, there were
eight minesoperated by fivemining companies. In
addition to PCC aggregates, these mines also
produced a full range of lower aggregate grades
for such productsasasphaltic concreteand base.

e The anticipated consumption of aggregate in the
San Gabriel Valley P-C Region for the next 50
years (through the year 2056) is estimated to be
307 million tons, of which 45 percent, or 138

million tons, must be PCC quality. Thisis nearly
doublethe 50—year consumption estimate madein
SR 159.

e Since 1985, permitted PCC—grade aggregate
reserves have increased from 67 million tons to
167 million tons, extending the projected
depletiondatefrom 2012to 2038.

e Approximately 10 percent, or 923@ acres of the
9,094 acres of lands designated by the SMGB in
1989, has been lost to land usesincompatible with
mining.

e An additional 6,638 acres of land containing an
estimated 472 million tons of PCC—grade
aggregate resources have been identified in the
San Gabriel Valley P-C Region.

Thepublication of Special Report 159, and itsupdate,
Specia Report 198, accomplish part one of the two—
part Classification—Designation process. Part two of
the two—step process, designation, isthe formal recog-
nition by the SMGB of lands containing mineral re-
sources of regional or statewide economic significance
needed to meet the demands of the future. In the years
sincetheoriginal publication of Special Report 159, ter-
mination of designation for certain areas where the di-
rect involvement of the SMGB is no longer required
havea sobeenidentified.

The State Geol ogist hasrecommended several candi-
dates, or areas, which meet or exceed the SMGB’s
threshold economic value, thus, each area may be con-
sidered for designation as an area of regional or state-
wide significance by the SMGB. These areas include
eight areas which have been reclassified as MRZ—2a,
and eight areasthat havebeenreclassifiedasMRZ—2b.

The State Geologi st also recommended five areasfor
termination of designation. Six areas (in five Sectors)
areidentified as potential candidates for termination of
designation status due to high—value incompatible land
use developments. Five areas, in Sectors A-3, B-2,
B—3, and B-5in the San Gorgonio Pass, are siteswhere
large, high—value wind-driven electrica generators
havebeen constructed. Onearea, Sector CinLittleMo-
rongo Canyon near Desert Hot Springs, isthesite of re-
cently constructed urban development and flood con-
trol infrastructure. These sites, located in the western
part of the San Gabriel Valey P-C Region, are shown
on Plate 1 (Western Area). In addition to the areas de-
scribed below, areasin Sectors E-1, E—2, and F are now
underlain by a utility corridor carrying fiber optic
cables. These areas amount to 100 acres containing 27
million tons of aggregate. Because these cables may be
relocatable, allowing for the mining of the underlying
aggregate, the State Geologist did not recommend ter-

1464



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

mination of designation statusfor these utility corridors
atthistime.

POLICY STATEMENT OVERVIEW

The proposed regulatory language would allow con-
sideration of new information obtained since the publi-
cation of the 1982 Mineral Land Classification study.
The proposed amended regulations reflect information
provided in CGS Special Report 209 which reported
that about 27 percent, or 1,234 acres of the 4,642 acres
of lands originally designated by the SMGB have been
lost toland usesincompatiblewith mining. Those 1,234
acres lost contain approximately 483 million tons of
PCC—grade aggregate resources, which is 20 percent of
the 2,402 million tons of aggregate resources desig-
nated in 1984. Furthermore, the report identified an
additional 281 acres of land containing more than 311
milliontons of PCC—grade aggregatein areas previous-
ly classified MRZ—3. These areas were reclassified as
MRZ-2 inthe update. Thereclassified areas areidenti-
fied as Sectors J, K, L, and M are newly identified ag-
gregate resource sectorsthat were not originally desig-
nated. Sector Jdelineates|and that hasbeenreclassified
in OFR 91-14 to MRZ-2 from MRZ-3 (Miller, 1994).
SectorsK, L, and M delineatelandsthat were classified
MRZ-2in SR 143 Part IV, but were not included in part
of asector.

Each Sector that may be considered for designation
as an area of regional or statewide significance by the
SMGB pursuant to Article 6, Section 2790 et seq.
(SMARA), meets or exceedsthe threshold value ases-
tablished by the SMGB. This proposed regulation is
necessary in order for the State to meet its aggregate
availability and sustainability needs.

The State Geologist also recommended six areas for
termination of designation in the San Gabriel Valey
P-C Region. Six Sectors were identified as candidates
for termination of designation status because of high—
valueincompatibleland use devel opments, particularly
urbanization and land filling. These areas are situated
within Sectors A (263 acres), B (12 acres), C (42 acres),
D (391 acres), E (422 acres) and | (104 acres), totaling
908 acres.

The proposed regulatory language is consistent and
compatiblewith existing state regulations. The specific
benefits anticipated by the proposed amendment pro-
vides nonmonetary benefits to the environment by
avoiding species conservation areas and habitat sensi-

tiveareas, while contributing to effortsto reduce green-
house gas emissions, and does not conflict with the
protection of public health and safety, worker safety, the
prevention of discrimination, the promotion of fairness
or social equity, and theincreasein opennessand trans-
parency in business and government, among other
things.

CEQA COMPLIANCE

The SMGB has determined that this rulemaking ac-
tionisnot aproject asdefinedinthe CaliforniaEnviron-
mental Quality Act (CEQA) and isexempt fromthere-
quirements of CEQA, Title 14, CCR, Section
15061(b)(3).

DISCLOSURES REGARDING THE
PROPOSED ACTION

The SMGB'’sExecutive Officer hasmadethefollow-
ing preliminary determinations:
M andate on local agenciesand schoal districts:
The adoption of this amended regulation does not
impose any new mandates on local agenciesor on
local school districts.

Costs or savings to any State agency: The
proposed amended regul ation imposes no savings
or additional expensesto stateagencies.

Cost toany local agency or school district which
must be reimbursed in accordance with
Government Code Sections 17500 through
17630: The proposed amended regulation does
not impose any additional cost obligationsonlocal
agenciesor onlocal school districts.

Other non-discretionary costs or _savings
imposed upon local agencies: No other
non—discretionary costs or savings to loca
agencies are imposed by the proposed amended
regulation.

Cost or savingsin Federal fundingtothe State:
Thereareno costsor savingsin Federal funding to
the State.

Significant statewide adver se economic impact
directly affecting businessincluding the ability
of California businesses to compete with
businessesin other states. No statewide adverse
impacts to California businesses result from the
adoption of this proposed amended regulatory
language.

1465



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

Potential cost impact on private persons or
directly affected businesses. The imposition of
the proposed amended language on a directly
affected local mining operation will have a
positive cost impact to that operation by the
recognition of designated mineral land of regional
significance which in some circumstances may
reducetheamount of time, thuscost, inacquiringa
permit to minefrom itslead agency. Furthermore,
termination of formally designated areas would
not haveany costimpact.

Results of Economic Impact Analysis. The
adoption of thisamended regul ationwill not:

e  Createnor eliminatejobswithin California;

e  Createnew nor eliminate existing businesses
withinCalifornig;

e  Expand businesses currently doing business
inCalifornia

The adoption of this amended regulation will,
however, benefit the health and welfare of
Cdlifornia residents and the state’s environment
by avoiding species conservation and habitat
sensitiveareas, aswell asreducing greenhousegas
emissionsrelated totransportation.

Significant effect on housing costs: Theadoption
of thisamended regul ationwill have no significant
effect on housing costs, but may reduce such costs
by providing a source of PCC—grade aggregate
closer tousersand market areas.

Effects on small businesses: The imposition of
the proposed amendment will have no cost impact
on small businesses. The SMGB is not aware of
any cost impacts that a representative private
person or business would necessarily incur in
reasonable compliance with the proposed action.
There are no costs related or associated with the
proposed designation of minera lands. Such
considerations require a lead agency to consider
the regiona significance of minera lands
designated by the SMGB when making land use
decisions, but do not impose any fees or costs to
small businessesaspart of that consideration.

CONSIDERATION OF ALTERNATIVES

The SMGB must determine that no reasonable alter-
nativethat it considersor that hasotherwisebeenidenti-
fied and brought to the attention of the SMGB would be
more effectivein carrying out the purposefor which the
action is proposed, or would be as effective and less
burdensome to affected private persons than the pro-
posed action, or would be more cost—effective to af-
fected private personsand equally effectiveinthe statu-

tory policy or other provision of law. The SMGB’s
Executive Officer has not identified any adverse im-
pactsresulting fromthe proposed regul ation.

No aternatives have been considered by the SMGB
at thistime that would be more effectivein carrying out
the purposefor whichtheregulatory actionisproposed,
nor have any other alternatives been proposed that
would be as effective and |ess burdensome to affected
privatepersons, lead agencies, or small businesses.

CONFLICT WITH FEDERAL REGULATIONS

Thisregulation change does not duplicate or conflict
with existing Federal statutes or regulations. Also, by
Memorandum of Understanding with the Federal Bu-
reau of Land Management, theU. S. Forest Service, the
Department of Conservation, and the SMGB, SMARA
and federal law are coordinated to eliminate
duplication.

GENERAL PURPOSE AND
CONDITION ADDRESSED

Article 6 of the Surface Mining and Reclamation Act
of 1975 (SMARA), commencing with PRC Section
2790, provides for the SMGB, based upon mineral in-
formation from the State Geol ogi st pursuant to subdivi-
sion (c) of PRC Section 2761, to adopt in regulation
specific geographic areas of the state as areas of state-
wide or regional mineral resource significance and
specify theboundariesof thoseareas.

At its September 9, 2010, regular business meeting,
the SMGB accepted California Geological Survey
(CGS) Specia Report 209 which updated information
previously presented in a classification report on Port-
land cement concrete—grade (PCC) aggregateinthe San
Gabriel Valey Production—Consumption (P-C) Re-
gion completed in 1988. The original classification
study by Kohler (1982) assisted the State Mining and
Geology Board (SMGB) inits subsequent mineral land
designation process, whereby the SMGB formally rec-
ognized in regulation lands containing resources of re-
gional or statewideeconomic significanceintheregion.
The SMGB designated construction aggregate resource
areas of regional significance in the San Gabriel P-C
Regionin SMARA Designation Report No. 3— Desig-
nation of Regionally Sgnificant Construction Aggre-
gate Resources in the Orange County — Temescal
Valley and San Gabriel  Valley Production—
Consumption Regions (August 1984). At itsMarch 10,
2011, regular business meeting, the SMGB accepted
the proposed new designations, and areasidentified for
termination of designation, for the San Gabriel Valley
P—C Region pursuant to PRC Section 2761. The 60—day
public comment period commenced on July 29, 2011,

1466



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

and ended on September 26, 2011. In addition, pursuant
to PRC Section 2793, apublic hearing was held on Au-
gust 30, 2011, in the City of Irwindale. During such
public comment period and hearing, no commentswere
received.

SPECIFIC PURPOSE

The proposed amended regulation Section 3550.5,
Article2 CCR, isintended to clarify and make specific
those mineral lands that are to be designated by the
SMGB as having regional significance within the San
Gabriel Valley P-C Region. These regulations are con-
tained under Article 2, titled Areas Designated to be of
Regional Significance.

The proposed amended regulations reflect informa-
tion provided in CGS Specia Report 209 which identi-
fied 281 acresof sectorized|andsavailable, and approx-
imately 311 million tons of PCC—grade aggregate re-
sources, to meet future aggregate needs. SectorsJ, K, L,
and M are newly identified aggregate resource sectors
that were not originally designated. Sector J delineates
land that hasbeenreclassifiedin OFR 91-14to MRZ-2
fromMRZ-3 (Miller, 1994). SectorsK, L, and M delin-
eate lands that were classified MRZ-2 in SR 143 Part
IV, but werenot includedin part of asector.

The State Geologist also recommended six sectors
for termination of designation. Six areas are identified
as potential candidates for termination of designation
status due to high—value incompatible land use devel-
opments. Theseareasaresituated within SectorsA (263
acres), B (12 acres), C (42 acres), D (391 acres), E (422
acres) and | (104 acres), totaling 908 acres.

Proposed amended regul ations, CCR Section 3550.5,
indicates reference to two plates (maps). These two
platesformanintegral part of theregulation.

STATEMENT OF NECESSITY

PRC Section 2790 provides the SMGB the authority
to adopt regulations that establish state policy for the
designation of mineral lands of statewide or regional
significance, in accordance with Article 6 (commenc-
ing with Section 2790) of this chapter, and pursuant to
PRC Section 2761. PRC Section 2790, states that after
receipt of mineral information fromthe State Geologit,
the SMGB may by regulation adopted after a public
hearing designate specific geographic areas of the state
asareasof statewide or regional significance and speci-
fy the boundariesthereof. Such designation shall bein-
cluded asapart of the state policy and shall indicatethe
reason for whichtheparticul ar areadesignatedisof sig-
nificance to the state or region, the adverse effects that
might result from premature devel opment of incompat-

ible land uses, the advantages that might be achieved
from extraction of the minerals of the area, and the spe-
cific goasand policiesto protect against the premature
incompatible development of the area. PRC Section
2791 also requiresthe SMGB to seek the recommenda-
tions of concerned federal, state, and local agencies,
educational institutions, civic and public interest orga-
nizations, and private organizations and individualsin
theidentification of areasof statewide and regional sig-
nificance. PRC Section 2793 allowsthe SMGB by reg-
ulation adopted after apublic hearing, to terminate, par-
tially or wholly, the designation of any areaof statewide
or regional significance on afinding that the direct in-
volvement of theboardisnolonger required.

In 2006, the California Geological Survey (CGS) in
their statewide report titled “Map Sheet 52 (Updated
2006), Aggregate Availability in California” noted that
the San Gabriel P-C Region 50—year demand for aggre-
gate was on the order of 1,148 million tons. Permitted
aggregate resources were on the order of 370 million
tons. The percentage of permitted aggregate resources,
as compared to the 50-year demand, was 32 percent,
significantly lower than the projected demand.

The proposed amended regulations reflect informa-
tion provided in CGS Special Report 209 which identi-
fied 281 acresof sectorized|andsavailable, and approx-
imately 311 million tons of PCC—grade aggregate re-
sources, to meet future aggregate needs.

The State Geologist also recommended six sectors
for termination of designation. Six areas are identified
as potential candidates for termination of designation
status due to high—value incompatible land use devel-
opments. Theseareasare situated within Sectors A (263
acres), B (12 acres), C (42 acres), D (391 acres), E (422
acres) and | (104 acres), totaling 908 acres.

IDENTIFICATION OF
TECHNICAL/THEORETICAL/EMPIRICAL
STUDIES, REPORTS, OR DOCUMENTS UPON
WHICH THE SMGB HAS RELIED

Designation is the formal recognition by the SMGB
of landscontaining mineral resourcesof regional or sta-
tewide economic significance that are needed to meet
the demands of the future. The original classification
study by Kohler (1982) assisted the State Mining and
Geology Board (SMGB) inits subsequent mineral land
designation process, whereby the SMGB formally rec-
ognized in regulation lands containing resources of re-
gional or statewideeconomic significanceintheregion.
The SM GB designated construction aggregate resource
areas of regional significance in the San Gabriel P-C
Regionin SMARA Designation Report No. 3— Desig-
nation of Regionally Sgnificant Construction Aggre-
gate Resources in the Orange County — Temescal

1467



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

Valley and San Gabriel Valley Production—Consump-

tion Regions (August 1984). At its September 9, 2010,

regular business meeting, the SMGB accepted Califor-

niaGeological Survey (CGS) Special Report 209 which
updated information previously presented in aclassifi-
cation report on Portland cement concrete—grade (PCC)
aggregate in the San Gabriel Valley Production—

Consumption (P-C) Region completedin 1988.

The updated report, prepared by CGS, SR 209, pres-
entedthefollowing conclusions:

e Asof January 2009, seven mines, operated by five
different mining companies, were producing
PCC—grade aggregate in the San Gabriel P-C
Region, along with afull range of lower aggregate
gradesfor such products as asphaltic concrete and
base.

e The anticipated consumption of aggregate in the
San Gabriel Valley P-C Region for the next 50
years (through the year 2058) is estimated to be
911 million tons, of which 638 million tons must
bePCCquality.

e Since 1980, permitted PPC—grade aggregate
reserves have increased from 280 million tons (a
19-year supply using the 1980 to 2030 projection)
to 328 million tons (a 20-year supply using the
updated 2009 through 2058 projection.

e  About 27 percent, or 1,234 acres, of the 4,642
acres of lands designated by the SMGB in 1984
has been lost to land uses incompatible with
mining. This equates to 435 million tons of
PCC—gradeaggregateresources|ost.

e Since the 1984 designation of PCC—grade
aggregate resourcesin the San Gabriel Valley P-C
Region, 435 million tons of aggregate resources
underlying 1,234 designated acres have been lost
to urban development and land filling, and another
406 million tons of aggregate resources have been
depleted due to aggregate mining. This has
reduced the designated PCC—grade aggregate
resources by about 35 percent, from 2,402 million
tonsto 1,561 milliontons.

e  Four additional aggregate resource areas totaling
281 acres and containing 311 million tons of
aggregate resources have been identified during
the updating of the P-C Region. These areas are
not designated.

The State Geol ogist hasrecommended several candi-
dates, or areas, which meet or exceed the SMGB’s
threshold economic value, and each area may be con-
sidered for designation as an area of regional or state-
widesignificance by the SMGB. SectorsJ, K, L,and M
are newly identified aggregate resource sectors that
werenot originally designated. Sector Jdelineates|and
that hasbeenreclassifiedin OFR 91-14to MRZ-2from

MRZ-3 (Miller, 1994). Sectors K, L, and M delineate
|andsthat wereclassified MRZ—2in SR 143 Part |V, but
were not included in part of asector. At the time of the
updated classification study, that threshold value
amounted to approximately 1.1 million tons of aggre-
gate. The permitted aggregate resources amounts con-
tainedinindividual Sectorsareconsidered proprietary.

The State Geologist also recommended six sectors
for termination of designation. Six areas are identified
as potential candidates for termination of designation
status due to high—value incompatible land use devel-
opments. Theseareasaresituated within SectorsA (263
acres), B (12 acres), C (42 acres), D (391 acres), E (422
acres) and | (104 acres), totaling 908 acres.

AVAILABILITY OF CHANGED OR
MODIFIED TEXT

After holding the hearing and considering al timely
and relevant commentsreceived, the SMGB may adopt
the proposed regulations substantially as described in
this notice. If the SMGB makes modifications which
aresufficiently related to the originally proposed text, it
will make the modified text (with changes clearly indi-
cated) availableto the public for at least 15 days before
the SMGB adopts the regulations as revised. Please
send requestsfor copies of any modified regulationsto
the attention of Mr. Stephen Testa at the address pro-
vided below. The SMGB will accept written comments
onthemodified regulationsfor 15 daysafter thedate on
whichthey aremadeavailable.

AVAILABILITY OF THE FINAL STATEMENT
OF REASONS

Uponitscompletion, copiesof the Final Statement of
Reasons may be obtained by contacting Mr. Stephen
Testaat theaddressprovided bel ow.

CONTACT PERSON

An interested person may request a copy of the pro-
posed amended regulation and the Initial Statement of
Reasons. Questions about the proposed regulation and
Initial Statement of Reasons can be directed to the
SMGB's office. All supplemental information, upon
which the regulation is based, is contained in the rule-
makingfile.

The rulemaking fileis available for inspection at the
SMGB Officeat 801 K Street, Suite 2015, Sacramento,
California, between 9:00 am. and 4:00 p.m., Monday
through Friday except during state holidays. Copies of
the proposed regulation and the Initial Statement of
Reasons may be requested by writing to the above ad-
dress, or viewed on the SMGB'’s Internet Web Site at:
http://www.conser vation.ca.gov/smgb.

1468



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

Inquiries concerning the substance of the proposed
amended regulation should bedirected to:

Mr. Stephen M. Testa, Executive Officer
StateMiningand Geol ogy Board

801K Street, Suite2015

Sacramento, California95814

Phone: (916) 322-1082

Fax: (916) 4450738

Stephen. Testa@conservation.ca.gov
OR

Amy Scott, Executive Assistant
StateMining and Geology Board
801K Street, Suite2015
Sacramento, CA 95814

Phone: (916) 322-1082

Fax: (916) 445-0738
Amy.Scott@conservation.ca.gov

TITLE 15. DEPARTMENT OF
CORRECTIONS AND REHABILITATION

NOTICEISHEREBY GIVEN that the Secretary of
the California Department of Corrections and Rehabi-
litation (CDCR), pursuant to the authority granted by
Government Code Section 12838.5 and Pena Code
(PC) Section 5055, and the rulemaking authority
granted by PC Section 5058, in order to implement, in-
terpret and make specific PC Section 5054, proposesto
amend Sections3173.2and 3174 inthe CaliforniaCode
of Regulations, Title 15, Division 3, concerning Visit-
ing Searches.

PUBLIC HEARING
Dateand Time: November 28,2012 —
9:00am.to10:00am.

Department of Correctionsand
Rehabilitation

KernRoom

1515 SStreet— North Building

Sacramento, CA 95811

Toreceivecommentsabout this
action.

Place:

Purpose:

PUBLIC COMMENT PERIOD:

The public comment period will close November 28
2012, at 5:00 p.m. Any person may submit public com-
mentsin writing (by mail, by fax or by e-mail) regard-
ing the proposed changes. To be considered by the De-
partment, comments must be submitted to the Depart-

ment of Correctionsand Rehabilitation, Regulationand
Policy Management Branch, PO. Box 942883, Sacra-
mento, CA 94283-0001; by fax at (916) 324—6075; or
by e-mail at RPMB@cdcr.ca.gov beforethecloseof the
comment period.

CONTACT PERSON

Pleasedirect any inquiriesregarding thisactionto:

Timothy M. L ockwood, Chief

Regulation and Policy M anagement Branch
Department of Correctionsand Rehabilitation
P.O. Box 942883, Sacramento, CA 94283-0001
Telephone(916) 445-2269

In the event the contact person is unavailable, inqui-
riesshould bedirected to thefoll owing back—up person:

G.Long
Regulation and Policy M anagement Branch
Telephone(916) 4452276

Questions regarding the substance of the proposed
regulatory action should bedirectedto:

Vaughn Cambridge
Correctional Counselor 1
FemaleOffender sProgram
916-323-4226

LOCAL MANDATES

Thisactionimposesno mandatesonlocal agenciesor
school districts, or a mandate which requires reim-
bursement of costs or savings pursuant to Government
Code Sections17500-17630.

e Costtoany local agency or school district

thatisrequiredto bereimbursed: None.
Cost or savingsto any stateagency: None.
Other nondiscretionary cost or savings
imposed onlocal agencies: None.
e Costorsavingsinfedera fundingtothe
stete: None.

EFFECT ON HOUSING COSTS

The Department has made an initial determination
that the proposed action will have no significant effect
onhousing costs.

SIGNIFICANT STATEWIDE ADVERSE
ECONOMIC IMPACT AFFECTING BUSINESSES

The Department hasinitially determined that the pro-
posed regulations will not have a significant statewide

1469



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

adverse economic impact directly affecting businesses,
including the ability of California businesses to com-
petewith businessesin other states.

RESULTS OF THE ECONOMIC
IMPACT ASSESSMENT

The Department has determined that the proposed
regulation will have noimpact in the creation of new, or
the elimination of existing jobs or businesses within
California, or affect the expansion of businesses cur-
rently doing business in California, or the health and
welfare of California residents, worker safety, or the
State’senvironment.

COST IMPACTS ON REPRESENTATIVE
PRIVATE PERSONS OR BUSINESSES

The Department isnot aware of any cost impactsthat
arepresentative private person or business would nec-
essarily incur in reasonable compliance with the pro-
posed action.

EFFECT ON SMALL BUSINESSES

The Department has determined that the proposed
regulations may not affect small businesses. It is deter-
mined that this action has no significant adverse eco-
nomicimpact on small businessbecausethey arenot af -
fected by theinternal management of Stateprisons.

CONSIDERATION OF ALTERNATIVES

The Department must determine that no reasonable
aternative considered by the Department, or that has
otherwisebeenidentified and brought to the attention of
the Department, would be more effective in carrying
out the purpose for which the actionis proposed, would
be as effective and |less burdensome to affected private
persons than the proposed action, or would be more
cost—effective to affected private persons and equally
effective in implementing the proposed regulatory ac-
tion. Interested persons are accordingly invited to pres-
ent statements or argumentswith respect to any alterna-
tives to the changes proposed at the scheduled hearing
or during thewritten comment period.

AVAILABILITY OF PROPOSED TEXT AND
INITIAL STATEMENT OF REASONS

The Department has prepared, and will make avail-
able, the text and the Initial Statement of Reasons
(ISOR) of the proposed regulations. The rulemaking

file for this regulatory action, which contains those
itemsand all information onwhichtheproposal isbased
(i.e., rulemakingfile) isavailableto the public upon re-
guest directed to the Department’s contact person. The
proposed text, ISOR, and Notice of Proposed Action
will aso be made available on the Department’s web-
sitehttp://www.cdcr.ca.gov.

AVAILABILITY OF THE FINAL STATEMENT
OF REASONS

Following its preparation, a copy of the Final State-
ment of Reasons may be obtained from the Depart-
ment’ scontact person.

AVAILABILITY OF CHANGESTO
PROPOSED TEXT

After considering all timely and relevant comments
received, the Department may adopt the proposed regu-
lations substantially as described in this Notice. If the
Department makes modifications which are sufficient-
ly related to the originally proposed text, it will make
the modified text (with the changes clearly indicated)
availabletothepublicfor at least 15 daysheforethe De-
partment adoptstheregulationsasrevised. Requestsfor
copies of any modified regulation text should be di-
rectedto the contact personindicatedinthisNotice. The
Department will accept written comments on the modi-
fied regulationsfor 15 daysafter the date on which they
aremadeavailable.

INFORMATIVE DIGEST/POLICY STATEMENT
OVERVIEW

PC Section 5000 provides that commencing July 1,
2005, any referenceto the Department of Correctionsin
thisor any code, refersto the CDCR, Division of Adult
Operations.

PC Section 5050 provides that commencing July 1,
2005, any reference to the Director of Corrections, in
this or any other code, refers to the Secretary of the
CDCR. As of that date, the office of the Director of
Correctionsisabolished.

PC Section 5054 provides that commencing July 1,
2005, the supervision, management, and control of the
State prisons, and the responsibility for the care, custo-
dy, treatment, training, discipline, and employment of
persons confined therein are vested in the Secretary of
theCDCR.

PC Section 5058 authorizesthe Director to prescribe
and amend regulations for the administration of pris-
ons.

Thisaction:

e Recognizes CDCR's role in increasing safety in
the institutions and adopts new procedures for

1470



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

screening all visitors to provide increased
uniformity and standardi zation.

e Establishesthat metal underwiresin brassieresare
no longer restricted.

e Allows visitors wearing military or law
enforcement type clothing in the visiting area if
they areonactiveduty orinanofficial capacity.

e Clarifies that visitors cannot wear clothing that
resembl es State—issued clothing worn by inmates
intothevisitingroom.

e  Provides the appropriate authority and direction
for steff.

SPECIFIC BENEFITSANTICIPATED BY THE
PROPOSED REGULATIONS

The Department has determined these proposed reg-
ulationswill protect the health and safety of California
residents, worker safety, the State's environment, will
prevent discrimination, promotefairnessor social equi-
ty, and increase openness and transparency in business
and government.

EVALUATION OF
INCONSISTENCY/COMPATIBILITY WITH
EXISTING REGULATIONS

The Department has determined that these proposed
regulations are consistent and compatible with existing
State laws and regulations. The Department reached
this conclusion because these regulations add specific
security guidelinesto existing visiting regul ations.

TITLE 17. CALIFORNIA INSTITUTE
FOR REGENERATIVE MEDICINE

Amendmentsto I ntellectual Property Regulations
Sections 100600, 100601, 100602 and 100608

Date: October 5,2012

Deadline for Submission of Written Comment:
November 19,2012—5:00 p.m.

PublicHearing Date: None Scheduled

Subject Matter of Proposed Amendments:
Amendmentsto I ntellectual Property Regulations

Sections Affected: The proposed regulatory action
amends sections 100600, 100601, 100602 and 100608
of Title17 of the CaliforniaCode of Regulations.

Authority: Article XXXV of the California Consti-
tution and Health and Safety Code Section 125290.40,
subdivision (j).

Reference: Section 125290.30, Health and Safety
Code.

INFORMATIVE DIGEST/POLICY STATEMENT
OVERVIEW

The California Institute for Regenerative Medicine
(“Institute” or “CIRM”) was established in 2005 after
the passage in 2004 of Proposition 71 (the “Act”), the
CaliforniaStem Cell Research and Cureslnitiative. The
statewideballot measure established anew state agency
to makegrantsand provideloansfor stem cell research,
research facilities and other vital research opportuni-
ties. The Independent Citizens' Oversight Committee
(“1COC") is the 29-member governing board for the
Institute. The ICOC members are public officials, ap-
pointed on the basis of their experience earned in
California’sleading public universities, non—profit aca-
demic and research institutions, patient advocacy
groupsand thebiotechnology industry. The Act charges
the ICOC with developing standards and criteria to
makegrant awardsandto devel op standardsand criteria
for proper oversight of awards. (8 125290.50.) In addi-
tion, the Act requiresthel COCto:

. . .[e]stablish standards that require that all grants
and loan awards be subject to intellectual property
agreements that balance the opportunity of the
State of California to benefit from the patents,
royalties, and licenses that result from basic
research, therapy development, and clinical trials
with the need to assure that essential medical
research is not unreasonably hindered by the
intellectual property agreements.” (8 125290.30,
subd. (h).)

Tothat end, CIRM has adopted rulesregarding I ntel-
lectual Property that balancethe needsdescribed above.

Under CIRM’s regulations, there are two revenue
sharing provisions. Section 100608(a) requires Grant-
ees and Collaborators to share 25% of their licensing
revenue in excess of $500,000. Thisrate is reduced in
accordance with the proportional share of CIRM fund-
ing which contributed to the licensed inventions and
technology as compared to the total project costs in-
curred during the project period (the “Proportionality
Reduction”). The other revenue sharing provisionis set
forthin section 100608(b). It providesthat Granteesand
Collaborators must share revenues resulting from
CIRM Funded Research asfollows: after revenues ex-
ceed $500,000, three times the grant award, paid at a
rate of 3% per year, plusuponearning $250M inasingle
calendar year, a onetime payment of three times the
award, plusupon earning revenuesof $500M inasingle

1471



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

calendar year, an additional onetime payment of three
timesthe award and finally in the instance where a pat-
ented CIRM Funded Invention or CIRM Funded
Technology contributed to the creation of Net Commer-
cial Revenue greater than $500M in a single calendar
year, and where CIRM awarded $5 million or more, an
additional 1% royalty on revenues in excess of $500
millionannually over thelifeof the patents.

The onetime paymentstriggered at $250 million and
$500 million in annual revenues, create an uneven pay-
ment obligation which is characterized as being
“lumpy” and could be a disincentive for the engage-
ment of industry. In addition, the Proportionality Re-
duction provided for in Section 100608(a) creates ad-
ministrative challenges and uncertainty. The following
proposed amendments seek to address these issues
whileat the sametime ensuring acomparable economic
returnto Caifornia

SB 1064, which was enacted by the Legislature in
2010 with CIRM’s support, codified the revenue shar-
ing formulas into law. In recognition of the relatively
early stage of the research and need to partner with in-
dustry in order to commercialize CIRM—funded dis-
coveries, SB 1064 authorized CIRM’'s Governing
Boardto modify theformulasif it determinedthat it was
necessary to do so either to ensure that research and
therapy development are not unreasonably hindered as
aresult of CIRM’sregulationsor to ensurethat the State
of Californiahasan opportunity to shareintherevenues
derived from such research and therapy development.
Theproposed amendmentsre-strikethe balancebothto
ensure that industry will partner with CIRM and to en-
sure that the State has the opportunity to benefit from
successful therapy devel opment.

Theproposed amendments:

e Smooth out payment obligations in order to
facilitate industry investment and engagement in
CIRM programs which, in turn, will leverage
CIRM’s funding and provide access to industry
know how

e Extend the revenue sharing obligations to
commercializing entities to ensure the State
reaizes revenues from successful therapy
devel opment

e  Simplify theproportionality calculationrelatingto
CIRM’s existing licensing revenue sharing
regulation

e  Maintaintheexisting revenue sharing schemeasit
pertains to non-profit grantees (except with
respect to the simplification of the licensing
revenuesharing proportionality cal culation)

e  Maximize the amount of funding that companies
can re-invest in product development, by
exempting pre-commercial revenues from
CIRM’srevenuesharing

e Maintain the requirement that funds generated
from CIRM'’s revenue sharing regulations are
depositedintheCalifornia sGeneral Fund

Specific Benefits:
The proposed amendments simplify revenue sharing
calculations, smooth out the payments made, and en-

surethe Staterealizesrevenuesfrom successful therapy
development.

I mpact on Existing StateRegulations:

CIRM hasdetermined that the proposed amendments
have no effect on existing state regulations. Therefore,
the proposed regul ationsare neither inconsi stent nor in-
compatiblewith existing stateregulations.

DISCLOSURES REGARDING THE
PROPOSED AMENDMENTS

CIRM hasmadethefollowinginitial determinations:
M andateon local agenciesand school districts:
None.
Submittal of Comments:

Any interested party may present comments in writ-
ing about the proposed amendmentsto the agency con-
tact person named in this notice. Written comments
must be received no later than 5:00 p.m. on November
19, 2012. Comments regarding this proposed action
may al so be transmitted viae—mail to ipamendments@
cirm.cagov or by facsimile transmission to (415)
396-9141.

PublicHearing:

At this time, no public hearing has been scheduled
concerning the proposed regulations. If any interested
person or the person’s representative regquests a public
hearing, he or she must do so in writing no later than
November 5, 2012.

Effect on Small Business;

CIRM hasdetermined that the proposed amendments
will have noimpact on small businesses. Theregulation
implements conditions on awarding and administering
grantsfor stem cell research. Thisresearchisconducted
amost exclusively by large public and private nonprofit
institutions. As such, the amendmentsto the regulation
are not expected to adversely impact small business as
definedin Government Code Section 11342.610.

Impact on L ocal Agenciesor School Districts:

CIRM hasdetermined that the proposed amendments
do not impose a mandate on local agencies or school

1472



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

districts, nor do they requirereimbursement by thestate
pursuant to Part 7 (commencing with Section 17500) of
Division 4 of the Government Code becausethe amend-
ments do not constitute a“new program or higher level
of service of an existing program” within the meaning
of Section 6 of Article XI11 of the California Constitu-
tion. CIRM hasal so determined that no nondiscretiona-
ry costs or savingsto local agencies or school districts
will result fromthe proposed amendments.

Costsor Savingsto StateAgencies:

CIRM has determined that no savings or increased
costs to any agency will result from the proposed
amendments.

Effect on Federal FundingtotheState:

CIRM has determined that no costsor savingsin fed-
eral funding to the state will result from the proposed
amendments.

Effect on Housing Costs:

CIRM hasdetermined that the proposed amendments
will haveno effect on housing costs.

Significant Statewide Adverse Economic Impact
Directly AffectingBusinesses:

CIRM hasmade aninitial determination that the pro-
posed amendmentswill not have asignificant statewide
adverse economic impact directly affecting businesses,
including the ability of California Businesses to com-
petewith businessesin other states.

Cost Impacts on Representative Private Persons or
Businesses:

CIRM has made an initial determination that the
adoption of these amendments will not have a signifi-
cant cost impact on representative private persons or
businesses. CIRM isnot aware of any cost impactsthat
arepresentative private person or business would nec-
essarily incur in reasonable compliance with the pro-
posed amendments.

Resultsof Economicl mpact Analysis:

The above analysisis based on that fact that the pro-
posed amendments do not impose new requirementson
existing business operationsor functions of other agen-
ciesor individuals, but implement standardsfor seeking
and using state grant funds for scientific research. In
most cases, such grantsincludefundsto cover overhead
and other indirect costs of the research, including most
compliance activities. CIRM has made aninitial deter-
mination that it is unlikely the proposed amendments
will impact the creation or elimination of jobs, the cre-
ation of new businesses or the elimination of existing
busi nesses, or the expansion of businessescurrently do-
ing business within the State of California, nor directly
impact the health and welfare of California residents,
worker safety, and the state’ senvironment.

Consideration of Alter natives:

In accordance with Government Code Section
11346.5, subdivision (a)(13), CIRM must determine
that no reasonable alternative it considered, or that has
otherwise been identified and brought to its attention,
would be more effectivein carrying out the purpose for
which the action is proposed or would be as effective
and less burdensome to affected private persons or
would be more cost—effective to affected private per-
sonsand equally effective in implementing the statuto-
ry policy or other provision of thelaw than the proposal
described in this Notice. CIRM invites interested per-
sonsto present statements or arguments with respect to
aternatives to the proposed amendments at the sched-
uled hearing or during thewritten comment period.
Availability of Statement of Reasons and Text of
Proposed Regulations:

CIRM has prepared an Initial Statement of Reasons,
and has available the express terms of the proposed
amendments, al of the information upon which the
amendmentsarebased, and arulemaking file. A copy of
the Initial Statement of Reasons and the proposed text
of the regulation may be obtained from the agency con-
tact person named in this notice. The information upon
which CIRM relied in preparing this proposal and the
rulemaking file are available for review at the address
specified below.

Availability of Changed or M odified Text:

After holding the hearing and considering all timely
and relevant comments, CIRM may adopt the proposed
amendments substantially as described inthisnotice. If
CIRM makesmodificationsthat are sufficiently related
to the originally proposed text of the amendments, it
will make the modified text (with the changes clearly
indicated) avail ableto the pubic for at least 15 days be-
fore it adopts the regulations as amended. Requests for
the modified text should be addressed to the agency
contact person named in this notice. CIRM will accept
written comments on any changesfor 15 days after the
modifiedtextismadeavailable.

Agency Contact:

Written comments about the proposed regulatory ac-
tion; requestsfor acopy of thelnitial Statementsof Rea-
sons, the proposed text of the amendments; and inqui-
riesregarding therulemaking filemay bedirectedto:

Scott Tocher

Counsel totheChairman, ICOC

Cdlifornial nstitutefor RegenerativeMedicine
210King Street

San Francisco, CA 94107

(415) 3969100

Questions on the substance of the proposed regu-
latory action may bedirectedto:

1473



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

Amy Cheung
Cdlifornial nstitutefor RegenerativeMedicine
(415) 396-9110

The Notice of Proposed Regulatory Amendment, the
Initial Statement of Reasons and any attachments, and
the proposed text of the amendmentsand existing regu-
lation are also available on CIRM’s website,
WWW.Cirm.ca.gov.

Availability of Final Statement of Reasons:

Following its preparation, a copy of the Final State-
ment of Reasons mandated by Government Code Sec-
tion 11346.9, subdivision (a), may be obtained from the
contact person named above.

TITLE 24. BUILDING STANDARDS
COMMISSION

NOTICE OF PROPOSED ACTION TO
BUILDING STANDARDS OF THE DIVISION
OF THE STATE ARCHITECT (DSA-AC)
REGARDING THE
CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE
CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS,
TITLE 24, PART 2
2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

Notice is hereby given that the California Building
Standards Commission (CBSC) on behalf of the Divi-
sion of the State Architect proposes to adopt, approve,
codify, and publish changes to building standards con-
tained in the California Code of Regulations (CCR),
Title 24, Part 2. The DSA-AC is proposing building
standardsrelated tothe2013 CaliforniaBuilding Code.

PUBLIC COMMENT PERIOD

A public hearing has not been scheduled; however,
written comments will be accepted from October 5,
2012, until 5:00 p.m. on November 19, 2012. Please ad-
dressyour commentsto:

CdliforniaBuilding StandardsCommission
2525 NatomasPark Drive, Suite130
Sacramento, CA 95833

Attention: Jim McGowan, Executive Director

Written comments may also be faxed to (916)
263-0959 or E—mailed to CBSC@dgs.ca.gov.

Pursuant to  Government Code  Section
11346.5(a)(17), any interested person or hisor her duly
authorized representative may request, no later than 15
days prior to the close of the written comment period,
that apublic hearing beheld.

POST-HEARING MODIFICATIONS TO THE
TEXT OF THE REGULATIONS

Following the public comment period, the CBSC
may adopt the proposed building standards substantial -
ly as proposed in this notice or with modifications that
aresufficiently related to the original proposed text and
notice of proposed changes. If modifications are made,
thefull text of the proposed modifications, clearly indi-
cated, will bemadeavailabletothepublicfor at least 15
days prior to the date on which the CBSC adopts,
amends, or repealsthe regulation(s). CBSC will accept
written comments on the modified building standards
during the 15—day period.

NOTE: To be notified of any modifications, you
must submit written/oral comments or request that
you benotified of any modifications.

AUTHORITY AND REFERENCE

The California Building Standards Commission pro-
poses to adopt these building standards under the au-
thority granted by Health and Safety Code Section
18928.

For DSA-AC thepurpose of these building standards
isto implement, interpret, and make specific the provi-
sions of Government Code Sections (GC88) 4450
through 4461, 12955.1 and 14679; Health and Safety
Code Section (H&SCS8) 18949.1 and 19952 through
19959; and Vehicle Code Section 22511.8. DSA-ACis
proposing thisregul atory action based on GC8 4450.

INFORMATIVE DIGEST

An informative digest drafted in plain English in a
format similar to the Legisative Counsel’s Digest shall
includethefollowing:

Summary of ExistingLaws

Government Code Section 4450 authorizes the State
Architect to develop regulations for making buildings,
structures, sidewalks, curbs, and related facilities ac-
cessibletoand usableby personswith disabilities.
Summary of Existing Regulations

Existing regul ationsareapplicableto:

1) Publicly funded buildings, structures, sidewalks,
curbsandrelatedfacilities;

2) All privately funded public accommodations, and
commercia facilities; and

3) Public housing and private housing available for
publicuse.

4) Any portable buildings leased or owned by a
school district, and

5) Temporary and emergency buildings and
facilities.

1474



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

Existing California state regulations incorporate
standardsthat are:
1) Not aigned nor consistent with those regulations
published in the Federal Register on September
15, 2010 by the United States Department of
Justice for Titles 1l and |11 of the Americans with
Disabilities Act of 1990 for barrier—free design
under:

e 2010 Standards for State and Local
Government Facilities: Title 11 (28 CFR part
35.151 New Constructionand Alterations);

e 2010 Standards for Public Accommodations
and Commercia Facilities: Titlelll (28 CFR
part 36 Subpart D, New Construction and
Alteration);

e 2010 Standardsfor TitlesIl and Il Facilities:
2004 ADAAG (36 CFR part 1191,
appendicesB and D).

2) Based on the Fair Housing Amendments Act of
1988, and

3) Basedonthe2009 International Building Code.
Summary of Effect

TheDivision of the State Architect hasinitially deter-
mined no adverse impact on small business. The pro-
posed modifications will benefit small and large busi-
nesses by eliminating forced violations of the federa
2010 ADA Standards, thus minimizing the potential for
disputes, claims and litigation. They will also provide
clarity of expectationsfor these accessibility items and
allow businessesto proceed with needed improvements
without fear they will need to be redone when the 2013
CBCgoesintoeffect.

Comparable Federal Statuteor Regulations

Revised regulations for Title Il and Title Il of the
Americanswith Disabilities Act of 1990 as adopted by
the US Department of Justice. The regulations provide
revised enforceable standards for accessible design,
known asthe 2010 ADA Standardsfor Accessible De-
signinthreeparts:

e 2010 Standards for State and Local Government
Facilities: Title Il Regulations at 28 CFR Part
35.151;

e 2010 Standards for Public Accommodations and
Commercia Facilities: Titlell1 Regulations at 28
CFR Part 36, SubpartD;

e 2010 Standardsfor Title!ll and 1l Facilities: 2004
ADAAG

Policy Statement Overview

After March 15, 2012, compliance with the 2010
Americanswith Disabilities Act Standards became the
soleoptionfor complying with national accessibility re-
quirements. The Division of the State Architect Access

Compliance unit is working to update its regulations
with the most stringent requirements of either the State
or federal standards, but until the 2013 California
Building Codeisadopted and becomeseffectiveon Jan-
uary 1st, 2014 therewill bedifferencesand conflictsbe-
tween the State and federal standards. Thisrulemaking
package addresses the limited number of conflicts
where compliance with the State standards forces a
violation of thecorresponding federal standards.

Evaluation of consistency

Therearenoinconsistent or incompatibleregulations
proposed.

OTHER MATTERS PRESCRIBED BY STATUTE
APPLICABLE TO THE AGENCY OR TO ANY
SPECIFIC REGULATION OR CLASS
OF REGULATIONS

There are no other matters prescribed by statute ap-
plicableto the Division of the State Architect, or to any
specificregulationor classof regulations.

MANDATE ON LOCAL AGENCIES OR
SCHOOL DISTRICTS

The DSA-AC hasdetermined that the proposed regu-
latory action would not impose anew mandate on local
agenciesor school districts.

ESTIMATE OF COST OR SAVINGS
(Government Code Section 11346.5(a)(6)) An estimate, prepared
in accordance with instructions adopted by Department of
Finance, of cost or savings to any state agency, local agency, or
school district. Provide a copy of the “Economic and Fiscal
Impact Statement” (Form 399)

A. Costor Savingstoany stateagency: NO.

B. Costtoany local agency requiredtobereimbursed
under Part 7 (commencing with Section 17500) of
Divison4: NO.

C. Cost to any school district required to be
reimbursed under Part 7 (commencing with
Section 17500) of Division4: NO.

D. Other nondiscretionary cost or savings imposed
onlocal agencies. NO.

E. Costorsavingsinfedera fundingtothestate: NO.

INITIAL DETERMINATION OF NO
SIGNIFICANT STATEWIDE ADVERSE
ECONOMIC IMPACT ON BUSINESSES

DSA-AC has made an initial determination that the
adoption of this regulation will not have a significant

1475



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

statewide adverse economic impact on businesses, in-
cluding the ability of California businessesto compete
with businessinother states.

DECLARATION OF EVIDENCE

No facts, evidence, documents, testimony or other
evidence has been relied upon to support theinitial de-
termination of no effect.

FINDING OF NECESSITY FOR THE PUBLIC'S
HEALTH, SAFETY, OR WELFARE

The proposed action does not require areport by any
business or agency, so the Division of the State Archi-
tect has not made afinding of necessity for the public’'s
health, safety or welfare.

COST IMPACT ON REPRESENTATIVE PRIVATE
PERSON OR BUSINESS

DSA-AC isnot aware of any cost impactsthat arep-
resentative private person or businesswould necessari-
ly incur in reasonable compliance with the proposed
action.

ASSESSMENT OF EFFECT OF REGULATIONS
UPON JOBS AND BUSINESS EXPANSION,
ELIMINATION OR CREATION

DSA-AC hasassessed whether or not and to what ex-
tent thisproposal will affect thefollowing:

[1 Thecreationoreliminationof jobswithinthe State
of California.

DSA-AC hasdetermined that the proposed action
hasno effect.

[1 Thecreation of new businesses or the elimination
of existing businesses within the State of
Cdlifornia.

DSA-AC hasdetermined that the proposed action
hasno effect.

[l The expansion of businesses currently doing
businesswiththe Stateof California.

DSA-AC hasdetermined that the proposed action
hasno effect.

[1 The benefits of the regulation to the health and
welfare of Californiaresidents, worker safety, and
thestate’senvironment.

The DSA has determined that the proposa
establishes minimum requirements to safeguard

the public hedth, safety and general welfare
through structural strength, means of egress
facilities, stability, access to persons with
disabilities, sanitation, adequate lighting and
ventilation, and energy conservation; safety tolife
and property from fireand other hazardsattributed
to the built environment; and to provide safety to
fire fighters and emergency responders during
emergency operations.

INITIAL DETERMINATION OF SIGNIFICANT
EFFECT ON HOUSING COSTS

DSA-AC hasmade aninitial determination that this
proposal would not have asignificant effect on housing
costs.

CONSIDERATION OF ALTERNATIVES

DSA-AC has determined that no reasonable alterna-
tive considered by the state agency or that has otherwise
beenidentified and brought to theattention of DSA-AC
would be more effectivein carrying out the purpose for
whichtheactionisproposed, or would beaseffectiveas
and less burdensome to affected private persons than
the proposed action, or would be more cost—effectiveto
affected private personsand equally effectiveinimple-
menting thestatutory policy or other provisionsof law.

AVAILABILITY OF
RULEMAKING DOCUMENTS

All of theinformation upon which the proposed regu-
lations are based is contained in the rulemaking file,
which isavailable for public review, by contacting the
person named below. Thisnotice, the expresstermsand
initial statement of reasons can be accessed from the
CdliforniaBuilding StandardsCommissionwebsite:

http://www.bsc.ca.gov/

Interested partiesmay obtain acopy of thefinal state-
ment of reasons onceit has been prepared, by making a
written request to the contact person named below or at
the California Building Standards Commission web-
site.

CBSC CONTACT PERSON FOR PROCEDURAL
AND ADMINISTRATIVE QUESTIONS

General questionsregarding procedural and adminis-
trativeissuesshould beaddressedto:

1476



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

EnriqueM. Rodriguez, Associate Construction
Analyst

Michael Nearman, Deputy Executive Director

2525 NatomasPark Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, CA 95833

TelephoneNo.: (916) 263-0916

FacsmileNo.: (916) 263-0959

PROPOSING STATE AGENCY CONTACT
PERSON FOR SUBSTANTIVE AND/OR
TECHNICAL QUESTIONS ON THE PROPOSED
CHANGES TO BUILDING STANDARDS

Specific questions regarding the substantive and/or
technical aspects of the proposed changesto the build-
ing standardsshould beaddressed to:

DennisJ. Corelis, Deputy State Architect
Ph. (916) 445-4167
Dennis.Corelis@dgs.ca.gov

Derek M. Shaw, Associate Architect
Ph. (916) 324-7178
Derek.Shaw@dgs.ca.gov

Division of the State Architect — Headquarters
1102 Q Street, Suite 5100
Sacramento, CA 95811
DSA Facsimile No: (916) 4457658

TITLE 28. DEPARTMENT OF
MANAGED HEALTH CARE

SUBJECT: Pervasive Developmental Disorder and
Autism Coverage, Adopting section
1300.74.73 in Title 28, California Code
of Regulations; Control No. 20123681

PUBLIC PROCEEDINGS

Noticeishereby giventhat the Director of the Depart-
ment of Managed Health Care (“Department”) pro-
poses to adopt a regulation under the Knox—Keene
Health Care Service Plan Act of 1975 (“Knox—Keene
Act”), section 1300.74.73, “Pervasive Developmental
Disorder and Autism Coverage.”

This rulemaking action proposes to adopt section
1300.74.73,inTitle28, CaliforniaCode of Regulations.
Before undertaking this action, the Director of the De-
partment (“Director”) will conduct written public pro-
ceedings, during which time any interested person, or

such person’sduly authorized representative, may pres-
ent statements, arguments, or contentions relevant to
theactiondescribedinthisnotice.

PUBLIC HEARING

No public hearing is scheduled. Any interested per-
son, or his or her duly authorized representative, may
submit awritten request for apublic hearing pursuant to
Section 11346.8(a) of the Government Code. The writ-
ten request for hearing must be received by the Depart-
ment’s contact person, designated below, no later than
15daysbeforethecloseof thewritten comment period.

WRITTEN COMMENT PERIOD

Any interested person, or hisor her authorized repre-
sentative, may submit written statements, argumentsor
contentions (hereafter referred to ascomments) relating
to the proposed regulatory action by the Department.
Comments must be received by the Department, Office
of Legal Services, by 5 p.m. on November 19, 2012,
which is hereby designated as the close of the written
comment period.

Please address all comments to the Department of
Managed Health Care, Officeof Legal Services, Atten-
tion: Jennifer Willis, Senior Counsel. Comments may
betransmitted by regular mail, fax, email or viathe De-
partment’ swebsite:

Website: http://dmhc.ca.gov/regulations/
Email: regulations@dmhc.ca.gov
Mail: Department of Managed Health Care
Officeof Legal Services
Attn: Jennifer Willis, Senior Counsel
980 9t Street, Suite500
Sacramento, CA 95814
Fax: (916) 3223968

Please note: if comments are sent via the website,
email or fax, there is no need to send the same com-
mentsby mail delivery. All comments, includingviathe
website, email, fax or mail, should include the author’s
name and a U.S. Postal Service mailing address so the
Department may provide commenters with notice of
any additional proposed changesto theregulationtext.

Please identify the action by using the Department’s
rulemaking title and control number, Pervasive Devel-
opmental Disorder and Autism Coverage, Control
No.2012—-3681inany of theaboveinquiries.

CONTACTS

Inquiries concerning the proposed adoption of these
regulationsmay bedirectedto:

1477



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

Jennifer Willis

Senior Counsel

Department of Managed Health Care
Officeof Legal Services

9809t Street, Suite 500
Sacramento, CA 95814

(916) 3249014

(916) 322—-3968fax
jwillis@dmhc.ca.gov

OR

EmilieAlvarez

Regulations Coordinator
Department of Managed Health Care
Officeof Legal Services

980 9" Street, Suite 500
Sacramento, CA 95814

(916) 4459960

(916) 322—-3968 fax
ealvarez@dmhc.ca.gov

AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENTS

The Department has prepared and has available for
public review the Initial Statement of Reasons, text of
the proposed regulation and all information upon which
the proposed regulation is based (“rulemaking file”).
Thisinformation is available by request to the Depart-
ment of Managed Health Care, Office of Lega Ser-
vices, 980 9th Street, Sacramento, CA 95814, Atten-
tion: Regulations Coordinator.

The Notice of Proposed Rulemaking Action, the pro-
posed text of theregulation, and theInitial Statement of
Reasons are al so available on the Department’ swebsite
a the “Open Pending Regulations’ section of
http://wpso.dmhc.ca.gov/regulations/.

You may obtain a copy of the final statement of rea-
sons once it has been prepared by making awritten re-
guest to the Regul ation Coordinator named above.

AVAILABILITY OF MODIFIED TEXT

The full text of any modified regulation, unless the
modification is only non-substantial or solely gram-
matical in nature, will bemade availableto thepublic at
least 15 days before the date the Department adoptsthe
regulation. A request for acopy of any modified regula-
tion(s) should be addressed to the Regulations Coordi-
nator. The Director will accept comments via the De-
partment’s website, mail, fax or email on the modified
regulation(s) for 15 daysafter the date on which themo-
dified textismade available. The Director may thereaf-
ter adopt, amend or repeal the foregoing proposal sub-
stantially asset forthwithout further notice.

1478

AUTHORITY AND REFERENCE

CdliforniaHealth and Safety Code Section 1344 au-
thorizesthe Director to adopt, amend and rescind regu-
lations as necessary to carry out the provisions of the
Knox—Keene Act, including rules governing applice-
tions and reports, and defining any terms, whether or
not used in the Knox—K eene Act, insofar as the defini-
tions are not inconsistent with the provisions of the
Knox—Keene Act. Furthermore, the Director may
waive any requirement of any rule or formin situations
where in the Director’s discretion such requirement is
not necessary inthe public interest or for the protection
of the public, subscribers, enrollees, or personsor plans
subject totheKnox—K eeneAct.

Health and Safety Code Section 1345 requires health
careservicesto befurnished by professional s, organiza-
tions, healthfacilities, or other personsor institutionsli-
censed by the Stateto deliver or furnish health care ser-
vices.

Health and Safety Code Section 1367 lays out the
general requirements that must be met by health plans
under the Knox—K eene Act, including the requirement
that ahealth plan provide enrolleeswith medically nec-
essary basic health care services and access to an ade-
guateprovider network.

Health and Safety Code Section 1374.72 requires
health plansto provide coveragefor diagnosisand med-
ically necessary treatment of specified mental health
conditions, including PDD and autism, under the same
termsand conditionsthat are applied to physical health
conditions. Health and Safety Code Section 1374.72re-
quiresall full-servicel health plan contractsto*“ provide
coverage for the diagnosis and medically necessary
treatment of severe mental illness[SMI] of a person of
any age, and of serious emotional disturbances of a
child.” SMI is specifically defined to include PDD and
autism.

Hedth and Safety Code Section 1374.73 alows
health plans to provide medically necessary BHT, in-
cluding ABA, to individuals with autism and PDD, be-
ginning July 1, 2012, by non-icensed professionalsin
compliancewith detailed criteriaset forth in the statute.
Health and Safety Code Section 1374.73 states that its
provisions do not apply to Healthy Families enrollees
and the California Public Employees Retirement Sys-
tem (“CaPERS’) members, it also specificaly states
that it does not affect, reduce, or limit the health plans
obligationsto cover medically necessary treatment, in-
cluding BHT, under existing mental health parity law,
Health and Safety Code Section 1374.72.

1 A full-service health plan is a health plan that offers al basic
health care services as required by the Knox—Keene Act.



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

INFORMATIVE DIGEST/POLICY STATEMENT
OVERVIEW

General Background

Autism spectrum disorders (“ASD”), including
PDD, are developmental disabilitiesthat can causesig-
nificant social, communication, and behavioral chal-
lenges over the span of a person’s entire life. These
conditions are typically diagnosed in early childhood
and are characterized by social and communication im-
pairments, focused interests, and repetitive behaviors.
Many children diagnosed with autism are also intel-
lectually disabled.2 The per—capitalifetime costs of au-
tism are estimated at $3.2 million, including lost pro-
ductivity and the need for adult care.3 A recent study by
the Centers for Disease Control and Prevention esti-
mates the prevalence of ASD at 1in 88 children, anin-
crease of 23 percent over two years.* The same report
noted that the prevalence of ASD inboysis1in 54 and
theprevalenceingirlsis1in 252.° Giventheincreasein
ASD diagnoses and the significant medical and finan-
cial implications for this growing population, uninter-
rupted behavioral healthinterventions, suchasBHT, in-
cluding ABA therapy, can substantially improve out-
comes for children diagnosed with these conditions.
Theseinterventions are critical and should be adminis-
tered at theearliest possibletime.

Research has shown that early and immediate inter-
vention is vital to effective treatment of PDD or au-
tism.® If ASD symptoms are apparent before the age of
3 years, treatment for the condition should begin im-
mediately upon diagnosis. However, disputes over
whether certain types of treatments are medically nec-
essary or acovered health care service often delay nec-

2 Geraldine Dawson et a, Randomized, Controlled Trial of an In-
tervention for Toddlers with Autism: The Early Start Denver
Model, Pediatrics, Vol. 125, No. 1 (Nov. 30, 2009), p. €18;
http://pediatrics. ublications.org/content/125/1/el7.
full.html.

3 Ibid.

4 Centersfor Disease Control and Prevention, Prevalence of Au-
tism Spectrum Disorders— Autism and Devel opmental Disabili-
ties Monitoring Network, 14 Sites, United States, 2008; Morbid-
ity and Mortality Weekly Report (Mar. 30, 2012);
http://www.cdc.gov/mmwtr/preview/mmwrhtml/
ss6103al.htm?s cid=ss6103al_w.

51bid.

6 A 2009 study compared young children (18-30 months) who re-
ceived comprehensive early intervention, including applied be-
havior analysis, for 25 hours per week to children who received
intervention from commonly available community providers.
Those who received comprehensive early intervention demon-
strated improved outcomes, including significant improvements
in 1Q, adaptive behavior, and diagnostic status compared to the
group who only received community interventions. Geraldine
Dawson et al, “Randomized, Controlled Trial of an Intervention
for Toddlers with Autism: The Early Start Denver Model,”
Pediatrics, Vol. 125, No. 1 (Nov. 30, 2009), p. €22.

essary treatment for children with autism.” This delay
can result in stifled improvement, severe impairment,
and permanent devel opmental damage that may not be
regained through later treatment.8 In addition, when
health plans deny or delay coverage for PDD and au-
tism, including ABA therapy, families with children
diagnosed with PDD or autism must either pay thou-
sands of dollars out—of—pocket for critical treatment or
forgo altogether beneficial and necessary BHT for their
children.

The Healthy Families program is California’s low—
cost insurance program that provides health, dental and
vision coverage to children who do not have insurance
and do not qualify for no—cost Medi—Cal. As of Apiril,
2012, the Healthy Families program had over 870,000
enrolled children.® The Managed Risk Medical Insur-
ance Board administers the Healthy Families program
and contracts with health plans to arrange and cover
health careservices.

Ca PERS provides comprehensive health benefits to
morethan 1.3 million Californiastate employees, retir-
ees and their families, and government agency and
school employees. CalPERS isthe largest purchaser of
health benefits in California and the second largest in
the country after the federal government. CalPERS of -
fers a choice of coverage between HMO coverage and
self—insured products. Two major health plansthat con-
tract with CaPERS are regulated under the Knox—
Keene Act: Kaiser Foundation Health Plan, Inc.
(“Kaiser”) and BlueShield of California(*BSC”).

It is estimated that 1 out of every 88 children has
ASD.10 Thismeansthat it can be estimated that at least
9,886 children in the Healthy Families program have
ASD. Using a conservative estimate that 25% of Cal-
PERS members are children under the age of 18, it can
be estimated that 3,693 CalPERS members have ASD.
With a per—capita lifetime cost for autism of $3.2 mil-
lion for the estimated 13,579 Healthy Families enroll-
ees and CalPERS members, this equals approximately
$43,452,800 in lifetime autism care, including health
carecosts, if servicesareinterrupted.

7 Since 2010, the Department’s Help Center has received 228
grievancesinvolving health plan denialsof ABA therapy. Inthose
cases where the ABA issue was resolved exclusively using the
Department’ s standard complaint process, 185, or approximately
81%, of the complaints were resolved in favor of the enrollee. In
those casesthat involved an IMR, 86% of the IMRswereresolved
in favor of the enrollee.

8 http://www.cdc.gov/nchddd/auti smifacts.html#3

9 http://ww.mrmib.ca.gov/mrmib/HFP/Apr_12/
HFPRptSum.pdf

10 Centersfor Disease Control and Prevention, Prevalence of Au-
tism Spectrum Disorders— Autism and Devel opmental Disabili-
ties Monitoring Network, 14 Sites, United States, 2008; Morbid-
ity and Mortality Weekly Report (Mar. 30, 2012);
http://www.cdc.gov/mmuwtr/preview/mmwrhtml/
$s6103al.htm?s_cid=ss6103al_w.

1479



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

The three largest health plans with Healthy Families
enrollees and CaPERS members are: 1) Kaiser; 2)
BSC; and 3) Anthem Blue Cross (“ABC"). Kaiser has
approximately 190,000 Healthy Families enrollees and
530,000 CalPERS members. BSC has approximately
33,000 Healthy Families enrollees!! and 400,000 Cal-
PERS members. ABC has approximately 197,000
Healthy Familiesenrolleesand no CalPERS members.

Cdliforniahasamental health parity law containedin
Section 1374.72 of the Knox—Keene Act. Thislaw was
enacted in 1999. The mental health parity statute does
not list the specific servicesthat health plans must cov-
er. Rather, itidentifiesspecific mental health conditions
(such as PDD and autism) that are subject to the stat-
ute’s requirements. The mental health parity statutere-
quires that health plans provide medically necessary
treatment for those conditions. Assuch, BHT isused to
treat individuals with both physical and mental health
issues and conditions.12 ABA therapy is a type of
BHT.13 ABA therapy is arecognized treatment used to
treat children with PDD or autism.14 ABA usesmodern
behavioral learning theory to modify behaviors by fo-
cusing on the observabl e relationship of behavior to the
environment. Because ABA comprises many assess-
ment and behavioral changing procedures, ABA canbe
amedical or nonmedical service depending on its ap-
plication. Since the implementation of mental health
parity in 2000, health plans have been required to cover
medically necessary treatments for autism, including
ABA services, when provided by alicensed individu-
al.15 SB 946, which relaxed the licensure requirements
for administering ABA therapy, did not affect this cov-
erage requirement for Healthy Families and CalPERS
enrollees.

Historically, health plansdenied claimsfor BHT, and
more particularly, ABA, for children diagnosed with
PDD and autism on the grounds that the services were
either not medically necessary or were experimental/
investigational. Those decisions by the health plans
were generally overturned by the Department’s exter-
nal review process known as Independent Medical Re-
view (IMR). However, afew years ago health plans be-

11 BSC will be exiting the Healthy Families program on October
31, 2012.

12 For example, see http://www.heal thline.com/gal econtent/
behaviora—therapy.

13 See the National Autism Center’s National Standards Project,
“Findings and Conclusions,” (2009).

http://www.national autismcenter.org/pdf/NA C%20Findings%
20& %20Conclusions.pdf.

14 Geraldine Dawson et a, Randomized, Controlled Trial of anIn-
tervention for Toddlers with Autism: The Early Start Denver
Model, Pediatrics, Vol. 125, No. 1 (Nov. 30, 2009), pgs. €21-22;
http://pediatrics.aappublications.org/content/125/1/el17.
full.html.

15 Health and Safety Code Section 1374.72(a).

gan denying coverage for those services atogether, ar-
guing they have no legal obligation to cover ABA be-
cause the services are: (1) not health care services and
health plans are only obligated under the Knox—Keene
Acttocover health careservices; (2) excluded under the
terms and conditions of the health plan contract; or (3)
educational services. Another frequent health plan ar-
gument wasthat since ABA services could be adminis-
tered by non-licensed individuals, they could not, asa
matter of law, be health care services. This argument,
however, ignored the fact that licensed health care pro-
viderswere authorized to provide BHT, including ABA
therapy, asanintegral part of apatient’streatment plan.

In the vast majority of casesthat cometo the Depart-
ment, the Department findsthat the requested ABA isa
covered health care service that must be provided by a
licensed provider. The determination whether ABA
therapy is a covered benefit requires a case—by—case
analysis and depends primarily on the licensed treating
provider's assessment and evaluation. If the treating
provider determinesthat therequested ABA therapy re-
quires the skill and expertise of alicensed health care
provider, then the services are likely to be considered
health care services and, consequently, a covered bene-
fit, subject to exclusions and limitations in the health
plan contract. If the individual’s condition does not re-
quire the skill and expertise of a licensed health care
provider, prior to July 1, 2012, the services were not
foundto beacovered benefit.

While health plan BHT denials have been frequently
overturned by the Department’s Complaint and Inde-
pendent Review Processes, 16 health planshaveresisted
developing adequate networks of licensed providers
with the skill and expertise to deliver medically neces-
sary BHT therapy, and particularly ABA. Health plans
generally have two reasons for failing to develop ade-
guate networks: 1) ashortage of appropriately licensed
providers willing to provide ABA, and 2) their claim
that ABA isnot a health care service. Currently, when
ABA services are deemed medically necessary, many
health plans enter into arrangements with a licensed
provider withBHT or ABA experienceonanindividual
patient basis. But that provider remains unavailable to
other health planmembersseeking similar services.

In July 2011, to improve access to ABA therapy, the
Department undertook enforcement actionsagainst two
of California's largest health plans: ABC and BSC for
their systemic denial of ABA authorizations for indi-
viduals with autism, in violation of Health and Safety
Code Section 1374.72, the mental health parity statute.
To avoid the prospect of litigation, these two major
health plans entered into settlement agreements with

16 Health and Safety Code Sections 1368(b), 1370.4, and
1374.30(d)(3).

1480



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

the Department to provide coverage for medically nec-
essary ABA services without waiving their coverage
and provider licensure defenses. Timerestraintsimped-
ed the Department’ s ability to secure similar settlement
agreements with the other full-service health plans!’
that are subject tothemental health parity statute.

Knox—K eeneAct and Other Statutory Provisions

Under the Knox—K eene Act, ahealth plan may be ob-
ligated to cover aservicebecauseitis: (1) abasic health
care service as defined in Health and Safety Code Sec-
tion 1345(b); (2) a specific service mandated by the
Legidlature; or (3) aservicethe health plan contractual-
ly agreedtoprovide.

Health and Safety Code Section 1345(b) of the
Knox—Keene Act defines the broad categories of basic
health care servicesthat health plans must offer, which
include physician services, both consultation and refer-
ral; hospital inpatient servicesand ambulatory care ser-
vices; diagnostic laboratory and diagnostic and thera-
peutic radiologic services, home health services; pre-
ventative health services; emergency health care ser-
vices, ambulance transport services, and hospice
care.18 Health and Safety Code Section 1345 requires
health care servicesto befurnished by professional’s, or-
ganizations, healthfacilities, or other personsor institu-
tions licensed by the State to deliver or furnish health
care services. Business and Professions Code Section
2052 states that only licensed individuals can diagnose
or treat a person for any physical or mental condition
unlessthe L egidlature provides an exception to the pro-
hibition.

Health and Safety Code Section 1367 sets forth the
general reguirementsthat health plans must meet under
the Knox—K eene Act, including the requirement that a
health plan provide enrollees with medically necessary
basic health care servicesand accessto an adequate net-
work.1® The Knox—Keene Act, with the exception of
specific health benefit mandates, does not attempt to
enumerate the specific health care services and treat-
ments that are included in the concept of “basic health
care services’ under Health and Safety Code Section
1367(i).20 As indicated above, in addition to basic
health care services, the Legislature enacts specific
health benefit mandates that require health plansto in-
clude specific services in their health insurance prod-
ucts(plansand policies).?!

I7 A full-service health plan is a health plan that offers all basic
health care services as required by the Knox—Keene Act.

18 Health and Safety Code Section 1345(b).

19 Health and Safety Code Section 1367(i).

20 For examples of required statutory benefit mandates see the
California Health Benefits Review Program, “Appendix 20:
Existing Mandates in California Law,” (2009) at
http://www.chbrp.org/documents/sb1704/ap_20.pdf.

21 hid., at p. 6.

In 1999, AB 88 (Thompson), Chapter 534, Statutes of
1999, Cdlifornia enacted a mental health parity law,
Health and Safety Code Section 1374.72 of the Knox—
Keene Act, which requires health plansto provide cov-
erage for diagnosis and medically necessary treatment
of specified mental health conditions, including PDD
and autism, under the same terms and conditions that
are applied to physical health conditions.?2 Health and
Safety Code Section 1374.72 requires all full-service
health plan contractsto “ provide coverage for the diag-
nosisand medically necessary treatment of severe men-
tal illness [SMI] of a person of any age, and of serious
emotional disturbances of achild.” SMI is specifically
defined toinclude PDD and autism.

SB 946 adds Section 1374.73 to the Knox—Keene
Act. Thestatuteprovides:

Every heath care service plan contract that
provides hospital, medical, or surgical coverage
shall also provide coverage for behavioral health
treatment for pervasive developmental disorder or
autism no later than July 1, 2012. The coverage
shall be provided in the same manner and shall be
subject to the same requirements as provided in
Section 1374.72. (Section 1374.73(a)(1),
emphasisadded.)

Health and Safety Code Section 1374.73 defines
BHT to mean professional services and treatment pro-
grams, including ABA and evidence-based behavior
intervention programs, needed to develop or restore
functioning in an individual with PDD or autism, and
meets criteria requirements such as a treatment plan
withmeasurablegoals.23

Health and Safety Code Section 1374.73(b) autho-
rizeshealth plansto use non-licensed professional sand
paraprofessionalsto deliver BHT: “[e]very health care
service plan subject to thissection shall maintain an ad-
eguate network that includes qualified autism service
providers who supervise and employ qualified autism
service professionalsand qualified autism service para-
professionals. ..” (Emphasis added.) Once SB 946
created an exception to the licensed provider require-
ment, the Legislature simply required health plans to
maintain an adequate network of qualified autism ser-
vice providers, professionals or paraprofessionalswho
provideand administer BHT, including ABA therapy.24

Health and Safety Code Section 1374.73(d) express-
ly excludes Healthy Families enrollees and CalPERS
members from the relaxed provider licensure require-
mentsthat apply to health plans under the Knox—K eene
Act and the Businessand Professions Code. Specifical-

22 Health and Safety Code Section 1374.72(a).
23 Health and Safety Code Section 1374.73(c)(1).
24 Health and Safety Code Section 1374.73(b).

1481



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

ly, Health and Saf ety Code Section 1374.73(d) provides
that the SB 946 requirementsdo not apply to health plan
contracts for: (1) specialized health plans that do not
provide mental or behavioral health services, (2) Medi—
Ca Managed Care, (3) the Healthy Families Program,
and (4) CaPERS.2

Health and Safety Code Section 1374.73(d) must be
read in conjunction with subsection (e), which empha
sizesthat, “Nothing in this section shall be construed to
limit a health plan’s obligation to provide services un-
der Section 1374.72.” Aspreviously discussed, Section
1374.72 of the Knox—K eene Act isthe existing mental
health parity law, which requires health plans to cover
medically necessary treatment for PDD and autism, in-
cluding BHT and ABA therapies, so long asthe service
isprovided by alicensed professional. After the July 1,
2012, implementation date of SB 946, health planscon-
tinued to be required to cover medically necessary ser-
vices for PDD or autism to Healthy Families and Cal-
PERS enrollees by licensed health care providers as
originaly contemplated by Health and Safety Code
Section 1374.72.
Health Plan Confusion Regarding Coverage
Requirementsunder theK nox—K eeneAct

On December 11, 2011 and April 26, 2012, BSC and
ABC notified the Department that effective June 30,
2012, they would cease providing ABA therapy pur-
suant to the terms of their respective settlement agree-
ments.26 BSC further informed the Department the
health plan believes that as aresult of the enactment of
SB 946, health plans have no legal requirement to pro-
vide BHT or ABA servicesto CalPERS members and
Healthy Families enrollees as of July 1, 2012, even un-
der existing mental health parity law.2” ABC verbally
communicated the same to the Department. The De-
partment understands that this position is shared by
many of the other full—service health plansthat provide

25 Health and Safety Code Section 1374.73(d).

26 See Attachment 1, December 7, 2011, Letter from Mary C. St.
John, Associate General Counsel, Blue Shield of California, to
Brent Barnhart, Director of the Department of Managed Health
Care: “Re: Enforcement Matters 10-560, 10-561, 11-022,
11-038, 11039, 11262, Settlement Agreement of July 1, 2011.”
See also April 26, 2012, Letter from Andrew Russell, Associate
General Counsel, Anthem Blue Cross, to Brent Barnhart, Director
of the Department of Managed Health Care, “ Re: Notice Pursuant
to Settlement Agreement.”

27 See Attachment 1, December 7, 2011, Letter from Mary C. St.
John, Associate General Counsel, Blue Shield of California, to
Brent Barnhart, Director of the Department of Managed Health
Care: “Re: Enforcement Matters 10-560, 10-561, 11-022,
11-038, 11039, 11262, Settlement Agreement of July 1,2011.”

1482

services to Healthy Families enrollees and CalPERS
members. BSC sent a second |etter to the Department
on February 27, 2012, reiterating its decision to cease
providing ABA services under the terms of the health
plan’s settlement agreement with the Department.28
The Department isalso currently reviewing health plan
filings that contain information regarding each health
plan’simplementation of SB 946. All health plans that
have Healthy Families enrollees and CaPERS mem-
bershave provided awritten affirmationintheir SB 946
filings that state it is their understanding that Healthy
Familiesand CalPERS coverageisexempt fromthere-
quirements of SB 946. Therevised Evidence of Cover-
age (“EOC") for most of the health planswith CalPERS
members or Healthy Families enrollees does not con-
taininformation regarding BHT, unlike other EOCsfor
different typesof coverage.

Following the receipt of the health plan communica-
tionsregarding cessation of ABA services, the Depart-
ment immediately commenced discussions with the
health plans. In June 2012, the Department entered into
limited informal interim agreements with BSC, ABC
and Kaiser inwhichthesethreemajor health plansagree
to continue covering BHT, including ABA, for Healthy
Familiesenrolleesand CalPERS membersafter the July
1, 2012 implementation date of SB 946. BSC agreed to
cover ABA through September 30, 2012 for Healthy
Families enrollees and CalPERS members and will
cover and authorize ABA services on or after June 15,
2012, for aperiod of three months. ABC agreed to fol-
low the terms of the previous executed settlement
agreement and issue 6 month authorizationsfor Healthy
Families enrollees, and more recently, the parties have
agreed to extend ABC’s interim agreement to Decem-
ber 31, 2012. These agreementsaretemporary in nature
and are not a permanent fix to the coverage disputes
amongst the parties. In addition, these settlements do
not bind the 25 other health plans that provide services
to Healthy Families enrollees. Kaiser agreed to cover
medically necessary BHT for both Healthy Familiesen-
rollees and CalPERS members diagnosed with PDD or
autismfor no specificduration.

OnJune 27,2012, Kaiser sent the Department a*“ Peti-
tion Requesting Initiation of Formal Rulemaking and
Promulgating of Regulations’ (“Petition”) requesting

28 See Attachment 2, February 27, 2012, Letter from Mary C. St.
John, Associate General Counsel, Blue Shield of California, to
Brent Barnhart, Director of the Department of Managed Health
Care: “Re: Enforcement Matters 10-560, 10-561, 11-022,
11-038, 11039, 11-262, Settlement Agreement of July 1,2011.”



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

that the Department adopt a regulation under Govern-

ment Code section 11340.6.2%9 The terms of the re-

quested regulationwould clarify:

e  Whether contracts between heath care service
plans and the Board of Administration of the
Cdifornia Public Employees Retirement System
(CAPERS) and the Healthy Families Program
(Healthy Families) administered by the California
Managed Risk Medica Insurance Board
(collectively referred to herein as the “Public
Purchasers’) must include coverage of Behavioral
Health Treatment (BHT), including applied
behavior analysis (ABA) defined in Health &
Safety Code§ 1374.73(S.B. 946);

e |[f DMHCrequirescoverageof BHT inhealth care
service plan contracts with Public Purchasers, the
licensure and certification requirements for
individualswho provideBHT;

e  Theongoing statutory obligations of the Regional
Centersto provide BHT to enrollees of the Public
Purchasers pursuant to the Regional Centers
contracts with the State of Californiafor services
governed by the Lanterman Act (Cal. Welf. &
Instit. Code 8§ 4500 et seqg.) and the Intervention
Services Act (Cal. Gov't Code 8§ 95000 et seq.) in
light of the statutory exemption contained in S.B.
946 for hedlth care service contracts with the
Public Purchasers.

The Department responded to the Kaiser Petition on

August 27,2012.30

Purposeof theRegulation

Thehealth plans’ stated confusion and misinterpreta-
tionregarding whether thereisastatutory obligation af -
ter July 1, 2012 to provide medically necessary services
will lead to denials or delays in authorizing BHT, in-
cluding ABA, to Healthy Families enrollees and Cal-
PERS members. These denials and delays could cause
stifled improvement, severeimpairment and permanent
developmental damage to impacted enrollees that may
not be regained through later treatment as well as sub-
stantial financial harm.

This confusion could also lead to negotiation prob-
lems with the Managed Risk Medical Insurance Board
(“MRMIB”) and CalPERS asthey attempt to negotiate
premium rates with health plans based on the scope of

29 See Attachment 3, June 27, 2012, Letter from Jerry Fleming,
Senior Vice President, Kaiser Permanente, to Brent Barnhart, Di-
rector of the Department of Managed Health Care: “Re: Petition
Requesting I nitiation of Formal Rulemaking and Promul gating of
Regulation.”

30 The Department and Kaiser entered into an agreement on July
24, 2012, extending the date that the Department could respond
to the Petition until July 27, 2012.

covered services for enrollees, and whether BHT, in-
cluding ABA, isincluded.

The regulation proposed in this rulemaking action
clarifies and makes specific the requirements within
State law. The regulation proposed in this rulemaking
action is neither inconsistent nor incompatible with ex-
isting stateregulations.

This regulation was initially adopted by the Depart-
ment as an emergency regulation that was approved by
the Office of Administrative Law on September 6,
2012.

Broad Objectivesand Benefitsof Regulation

Pursuant to  Government Code  Section
11346.5(8)(3)(C), the broad objectives and benefits of
this proposed regulation, subdivision (8)(1), is that it
will clarify that SB 946 did not reduce, limit, or exclude
coverage for medically necessary mental health ser-
vices, including BHT and ABA, provided by licensed
providersfor Healthy Families enrollees and CalPERS
members after the July 1, 2012 implementation date of
the legidation. The public health will be protected be-
cause the regulation will ensure that Healthy Families
enrollees and CalPERS members access to medically
necessary BHT, including applied behavior analysis, is
not interrupted or delayed. It is generally recognized
that significant interruptionsor delaysin securing med-
ically necessary BHT, including ABA therapy, can re-
sult in stunted and permanent impaired devel opmental
outcomes and can cause irreparable disability to chil-
drenwith PDD and autism.

Pursuant to  Government Code  Section
11346.5(a)(3)(C), the broad objectives and benefits of
this proposed regulation, subdivision (a)(2) is that
health plans cover health care servicesthat are medical -
ly necessary and health plans may perform utilization
review of requested health care services to ensure that
theservicesaremedically necessary.

Pursuant to  Government Code  Section
11346.5(a)(3)(C), the broad objectives and benefits of
this proposed regulation, subdivisions
@B)(A)—a)(3)(D), is that the Department must be
able to verify the adequacy of each health plan’'s BHT
network to protect the public health. Thisreporting re-
quirement will help ensure that children with autism
will not be subject to potentia delays and/or interrup-
tionsinaccessing BHT, including ABA services, which
can result in stifled improvement, severe impairment
and permanent devel opmental damage that may not be
regained through later treatment. The network report-
ing informationwill alow the Department to determine
service areas where provider shortages exist and to
identify strategies, in collaboration with the health
plans, to make certain that children with autism who
live in underserved or other challenged geographic

1483



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

areasreceivetimely accessto medically necessary BHT
services and are not subject to potential delaysor inter-
ruptionsin carebecauseof aninadeguate network.

ComparisontoExistingRegulations

Pursuant to  Government Code  Section
11346.5(a)(3)(D) the proposed regulation was eva-
luated and was not found to be inconsistent or incom-
patible with existing state regul ations. The Department
compared thefollowing related existing regul ations | o-
cated in the California Code of Regulations, title 28:
1300.74.72, 1300.67.2, 1300.67.2.1, 1300.67.2.2,
1300.45, and 1300.74.30.

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Pursuant to  Government Code  Section
11346.5(a)(13), the Department must determinethat no
reasonabl e alternative considered by the Department or
has otherwisebeenidentified or brought to the attention
of the Department would be more effective in carrying
out the purpose for which the above action is proposed
or would be as effective and less burdensome to af-
fected private persons than the proposed action, or
would be more cost—effective to affected private per-
sonsand equally effective in implementing the statuto-
ry policy or other provisionsof law.

The Department invitesinterested personsto present
statements or arguments with respect to alternativesto
therequirements of the proposed regulationsduring the
written comment period.

SUMMARY OF FISCAL IMPACT

e Mandate on local agencies and school districts:
None.

e Cost or Savings to any State Agency: Yes (see
below).

e Direct or Indirect Costs or Savings in Federal
Fundingtothe State: None.

e Cost to Local Agencies and School Districts
Required to be Reimbursed under Part 7
(commencing with Section 17500) of Division 4
of the Government Code: None.

e Costs to private persons or businesses directly
affected: The Department is not aware of any cost
impacts that a representative private person or
business would necessarily incur in reasonable
compliancewiththeproposed action.

e EffectonHousing Costs: None.

e  Other non—discretionary cost or savings imposed
uponlocal agencies: None.

COSTS OR SAVING TO STATE AGENCY

The Depatment of Developmental Services
(“DDS") states in the May 2012 Revised Budget that
there will be an anticipated savings of $69.4 million to
the General Fund resulting from the implementation of
SB 946, because health plansarenow authorized asare-
sult of this bill to provide medically necessary behav-
ioral health treatments, including applied behavior
analysis, through non-icensed professionals and para-
professionalsthat meet certain specified criteria. These
savingsstem from aDDSassumption that certain medi-
cally necessary behavioral services that health plans
previously refused to cover and pay for because they
were provided by non-icensed individualswill now be
available (reimbursable) through private health insur-
ancecoverage.

DETERMINATIONS

The Department hasmadethefollowinginitial deter-
minations:

The Department has determined the regulation will
not impose a mandate on local agencies or school dis-
tricts, nor are there any costs requiring reimbursement
by Part 7 (commencing with Section 17500) of Division
4 of theGovernment Code.

The Department has determined the regulation will
haveno significant effect on housing costs.

The Department has determined the regulation does
not affect small businesses. Health care service plans
are not considered asmall business under Government
Code Section 11342.610(b) and(c).

The Department has determined the regulation will
not have a significant statewide adverse economic im-
pact directly affecting businesses, including the ability
of Californiabusinessesto compete with businessesin
other states.

The Department has determined that this regulation
will have no cost or savings in federal funding to the
state.

RESULTS OF THE ECONOMIC
IMPACT ANALYSIS
(Government Code § 11346.3(b))

Creation or Elimination of JobsWithin the State of
California

Thisregulation is intended to clarify and make spe-
cific the existing State law for health plans under the
Knox—KeeneAct. Thisregulationisdesigned to clarify
and make specific that health plans are required to pro-
vide medically necessary BHT, including ABA, for
Ca PERS members and Healthy Families enrollees un-
der existing law. The health plans continueto be ableto

1484



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

conduct utilization review to determine the medical
necessity of these requested services. Health plans sub-
ject to the requirements of SB 946 must also demon-
strate that they have an adequate network of providers
to treat enrollees as required by thislegislation. There-
fore, the Department has determined the regul ation will
not significantly affect the creation or elimination of
jobswithinthe Stateof California.

Creation of New or Elimination of Jobs Within the
Stateof California

Thisregulation is intended to clarify and make spe-
cific the existing State law for health plans under the
Knox—KeeneAct. Thisregulationisdesigned to clarify
and make specific that health plans are required to pro-
vide medically necessary BHT, including ABA, for
CalPERS members and Healthy Families enrollees un-
der existing law. The health plans continueto be ableto
conduct utilization review to determine the medical
necessity of these requested services. Health plans sub-
ject to the requirements of SB 946 must also demon-
strate that they have an adequate network of providers
totreat enrolleesasrequired by thislegislation. TheDe-
partment has determined the regulation will not signifi-
cantly affect the creation of new businessesor theelimi-
nation of existing busi nesseswithin the State of Califor-
nia.

Expansion of Businesses or Elimination of Existing
BusinessesWithin theStateof California

Thisregulation is intended to clarify and make spe-
cific the existing State law for health plans under the
Knox—Keene Act. Thisregulationisdesignedto clarify
and make specific that health plans are required to pro-
vide medically necessary BHT, including ABA, for
Cal PERS members and Healthy Families enrollees un-
der existing law. The health plans continueto be ableto
conduct utilization review to determine the medical
necessity of these requested services. Health plans sub-
ject to the requirements of SB 946 must also demon-
strate that they have an adequate network of providers
totreat enrolleesasrequired by thislegislation. TheDe-
partment has determined the regulation will not signifi-
cantly affect the expansion of businesses currently do-
ing businesswithinthe State of California.

BENEFITS OF THE REGULATION

This regulation will clarify that SB 946 did not re-
duce, limit, or exclude coverage for medically neces-
sary mental health services, including BHT and ABA,
provided by licensed providersfor Healthy Familiesen-
rollees and CaPERS members after the July 1, 2012
implementation date of the legislation. Thisregulation
benefitsthe public by making specific that health plans
continueto beobligated to provide medically necessary

BHT, including ABA, to CaPERS members and
Healthy Families enrollees. The public health will be
protected because the regulation will ensure that
Healthy Families enrollees and CaPERS members
access to medically necessary BHT, including applied
behavior analysis, is not interrupted or delayed. It is
generally recognized that significant interruptions or
delaysin securing medically necessary BHT, including
ABA therapy, can result in stunted and permanent im-
paired developmental outcomesand can causeirrepara-
bledisability to childrenwith PDD and autism. Thereg-
ulation also clarifies that health plans continue to be
permitted to perform utilization review of requested
health care services to ensure that the prescribed ser-
vicesaremedically necessary.

Thisregulation isnecessary so that the Department is
able to verify the adequacy of each health plan’'s BHT
network to protect the public health. The benefit of this
reporting requirement is that it will help ensure that
children with autism will not be subject to potential de-
lays and/or interruptions in accessing BHT, including
ABA services, which can result in stifled improvement,
severeimpairment and permanent devel opmental dam-
age that may not be regained through later treatment.
The network reporting information will allow the De-
partment to determine service areas where provider
shortages exist and to identify strategies, in collabora-
tion with the health plans, to make certain that children
with autism who live in underserved or other chal-
lenged geographic areasreceivetimely accessto medi-
cally necessary BHT servicesand are not subject to po-
tential delays or interruptionsin care because of anin-
adequatenetwork.

ATTACHMENT 1
Blue Shield of California
December 7, 2011

Brent Barnhart, Director
Department of Managed Health Care
980 Ninth Street, Suite 500
Sacramento, CA 95814

Re: Enforcement Matters 10-560, 10-561,
11-022,11-038, 11-039, 11-262
Settlement Agreement of July 11,2011
Dear Mr. Barnhart:

This letter serves to notify the Department of Man-
aged Health Care (the “Department”) that the Califor-
nia L egislature hastaken action that impactsthe Settle-
ment Agreement between the Department and Blue
Shield of California (the “Plan”) dated July 11, 2011

1485



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

(the“ Agreement™). While the Plan could cease perfor-
mance under the Agreement, the Plan intendsto contin-
ue covering ABA servicesto provide its members con-
tinuity. However, in order to transition membersto the
coverage contemplated by the Legidature, the Plan is
proposingto amend the Agreement, asdescribed bel ow.

Pursuant to Paragraph J of Section Il of the Agree-
ment, the Plan has the right to cease performance upon
60 days notice to the Department that an act by the
Cdlifornia Legislature supports the Plan’s contention
that ABA isnot required to be covered under the Knox—
Keene Act. On October 9, 2011, SB 946 (Steinberg,
Chapter 650) was enacted into Californialaw. Thishill
requires health care service plans to provide coverage
of behavioral treatment, including Applied Behavior
Anaysis (“ABA™) services, beginning July 1, 2012.
Thebenefit mandate imposed by SB 946 does not apply
to CalPERS or Healthy Families members. Additional-
ly, themandateto providethe coverageisinoperativeas
of July 1, 2014 and does not require coverage beyond
that whichisrequired as an essential benefit under fed-
eral regulations(currently undefined).

The Plan contends that SB 946 provides legidative
confirmation that health care service plansare under no
obligation to cover ABA servicesprior to July 1, 2012.
However, the Plan will continue covering ABA whileit
implements the requirements of SB 946. In order to fa-
cilitate asmooth transition from the Settlement Agree-
ment to SB 946, and in recognition of the new law, the
Plan proposesamending the Agreement asfollows:

1) The Agreement will automatically terminate at
midnight June 30, 2012.

2) Authorizations for services made pursuant to the
Agreement will bephased outtoend July 1,2012.

3) From January 1, 2012 to March 31, 2012 Blue
Shield will cover ABA services for an initial 3
month period and will not dispute the medical
necessity of the servicesor the frequency of which
theservicesareprescribed.

4)  Authorizations made pursuant to the Agreement
fromApril 1,2012to June30will end July 1,2012.
After April 1 and after the plan's SB 946
implementation filing is submitted, the Plan will
have the option to cover ABA services pursuant to
itsSB 946 filing.

5) Healthy Families and CaAPERS members will
continuetoreceivecoverageuntil July 1, 2012.

6) Beginning January 1, 2012, once the enrollee has
received services for the initidl six— or
three-month period, ongoing authorizations will
be subject to medical necessity review.

7)  Amendments to the Agreement will not impact
authorizationscurrently in effect.

Thank you for your prompt attention to this matter.
Pleasefee freeto contact mewithany questions.

Very truly yours,

g/s
Mary C. St. John, Esqg.
Associate General Counsel

Anthem Blue Cross
April 26,2012

Mr. Brent Barnhart
Director
Ms. MaureenMcKennan
Deputy Director of Planand Provider Relations
CdliforniaDepartment of Managed Health Care
980 Ninth Street, Suite 500
Sacramento, CA 95814
RE: NoticePursuant to Settlement Agreement
Dear Mr. Barnhart and Ms. McK ennan:

Thisletter servesasnoticeto the Department of Man-
aged Health Care (the “ Department”) that as of July 1,
2012, the effective date of the ABA coverage mandate
in California SB 946, Blue Cross of CaliforniadbaAn-
them Blue Cross (* Anthem Blue Cross’) will ceaseto
perform its obligations under the Settlement Agree-
ment that the Department and Anthem Blue Cross en-
tered into on July 15, 2011 (the “Settlement Agree-
ment”), asprovidedforinthe Settlement Agreement.

Paragraph C of the Settlement Agreement states that
“BLUE CROSS agrees to arrange for the provision of
all medically necessary ABA servicesfor the treatment
of PDD or ASD for al current and future Enrollees and
the Subject Enrollees, in accordance with the terms of
this Agreement, subject to any devel opment or change
inlaw or regulation, asset forthinparagraph I, that clar-
ifies BLUE CROSS' legal obligations with respect to
ABA services.”

SB 946 isachangein law that clarifies Anthem Blue
Cross legal obligations with respect to ABA services
by requiring every health care serviceplanthat provides
hospital, surgical or medical coverage to also provide
coverage for behavioral health treatment (including
ABA services) for pervasive developmental disorder
andautismasof July 1,2012.

Pursuant to paragraphs C and | of the Settlement
Agreement, the enactment of SB 946 relieves Anthem
Blue Cross of its responsibility to perform in accor-
dance with any provision of the Settlement Agreement
as of July 1, 2012. Consequently, Anthem will change
its practices as of that date to comply with SB 946 and
cease to perform under the Settlement Agreement as of
that date.

Anthem Blue Cross is willing to work with the De-
partment on atransition plan for enrollees who are re-

1486



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

ceiving coverage for ABA services pursuant to the
Settlement Agreement asof July 1, 2012.

Please feel free to call me at (818) 2342217 if you
haveany questionsabout thisl etter.

Sincerely yours,

g/s
Andrew Russell
Associate General Counsel

cc. Tony Manzanetti, Deputy Director,
DMHC Officeof Enforcement

ATTACHMENT 2

Blue Shield of California

February 27,2012

Brent Barnhart, Director
Department of Managed Health Care
980 9" Street, Suite 500

Sacramento, California95814

Re: Enforcement Matters 10-560, 10-561,
11022, 11-039, 11262 Notice of
Termination of the Settlement Agreement of
July 11,2011 reABA Services

Dear Mr. Barnhart:

On December 7, 2011, Blue Shield of California(the
“Plan™) gave notice pursuant to Paragraph J of Section
Il of the Settlement Agreement of July 11, 2011 (the
“Agreement”) between the Plan and the Department of
Managed Health Care (the “Department”) that actions
of the CaliforniaL egislature supported the Plan’s posi-
tion that ABA is not required to be covered under the
Knox—Keene Act. Thereafter, the Plan and the Depart-
ment entered into good faith negotiations to amend the
Agreement consistent with the enactment of SB 946
and in anticipation of the July 1, 2012 effective date of
Health& Safety Code§ 1374.73.

Regrettably, those negotiations have not resulted in
an agreement to amend the Agreement. Pursuant to
Paragraph J, the Plan hereby givesnoticethat it consid-
ersthe Agreement to have terminated, effective Febru-
ary 5, 2012, and will cease performance under the
Agreement. To avoid disruption to Plan enrollees, the
Planwill continueto authorize ABA servicesconsi stent
with the Agreement Section I1.A. However, all autho-
rizations under the Agreement will end no later than
June30, 2012.

If Department has further questions or believes that
additional information is required, please do not hesi-
tateto contact theundersigned.

Sincerely,

g/s
Mary C. St. John, Esq.
Associate General Counsel

cc:  MaureenMcKennan, Deputy Director,

Planand Provider Relations

Anthony Manzanetti, Deputy Director,
Officeof Enforcement

Holly Pearson, Deputy Director and
General Counsel

Gretchen M. Lachance, Esqg.

Kathleen Lynaugh, Esg.

ATTACHMENT 3

Kaiser Permanente

June27,2012

Brent Barnhart

Director

Department of Managed Health Care
980 9t Street, Suite500

Sacramento, CA 95814-2725

Re: Petition Reguesting Initiation of Formal
Rulemaking and Promulgating of

Regulations
Dear Director Barnhart:

Pursuant to California Government Code Section
11340.6, Kaiser Foundation Health Plan, Inc. (“Peti-
tioner”) petitions the Department of Managed Health
Care (“DMHC”) to initiate formal rulemaking and to
promul gateregulationstoclarify:

(1) Whether contractsbetween health careserviceplans
and the Board of Administration of the California
Public  Employees  Retirement  System
(“CaPERS’) and the Healthy Families Program
(“Hedlthy Families’) administered by the
California Managed Risk Medica Insurance
Board (collectively referred to herein as the
“Public Purchasers’) must include coverage of
Behavioral Health Treatment (“BHT”) including
Applied Behavioral Analysis (“*ABA”) defined in
Health & Safety Code Section 1374.73 (“S.B.
946");

1487



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

(2) If DMHC requires coverage of BHT in health care
service plan contracts with Public Purchasers, the
licensure and certification requirements for
individualswhoprovideBHT;

(3) The ongoing statutory obligations of the Regional
Centersto provide BHT to enrollees of the Public
Purchasers pursuant to the Regional Centers
contracts with the State of Californiafor services
governed by the Lanterman Act (Cal. Welfare &
Institutions Code 84500 et seq) and the
Intervention Services Act (Cal. Government Code
8 95000 et seq.) inlight of the statutory exemption
contained in S.B. 946 for hedth care service
contractswith the Public Purchasers.

S.B. 946 mandates that certain Knox—Keene health
care service plans “provide coverage for behavioral
health treatment for pervasive developmental disorder
or autism no later than July 1, 2012.” Cal. Hedlth &
Safety Code § 1374.73(a)(1). However, S.B. 946 con-
tainsaprovision exempting certain types of plansfrom
itsmandates(inrelevant part):

(d) Thissectionshall not apply tothefollowing:

(2) A hedth care service plan contract in
the Medi—Cal program (Chapter 7
(commencing with Section 14000) of Part 3
of Division 9 of the Welfare and Institutions
Code).

(3) A hedlth care service plan contract in
the Healthy Families Program (Part 6.2
(commencing with Section 12693) of
Division 2 of thelnsurance Code).

(4) A hedth care benefit plan or contract
entered into with the Board of
Administration of the Public Employees
Retirement System pursuant to the Public
Employees’ Medical and Hospital Care Act
(Part 5 (commencing with Section 22750) of
Division 5 of Title 2 of the Government
Code).

Id., 8 1374.73 (d)(1)—(4).

The plain statutory language, legislative history, and
variouslegidative analyses of S.B. 946 appear to dem-
onstrate the California Legislature's explicit and pur-
poseful exclusion of health care service plan contracts
with Medi—Cal, Healthy Families and CalPERS from
S.B. 946'scoverage mandates. Initial draftsof S.B. 946
required all health care service plan contracts, except
for contracts with the Medi—Cal program, to provide
coverage for BHT.1 A report analyzing the initial draft
of S.B. 946 determined that the coverage mandates

1 cdlifornia State Senate A ppropriations Committee Fiscal Sum-
mary, September 9, 2011, at p. 2.

would cost the State more than $50 million annually for
Healthy Families and CalPERS enrollees alone.2 Sub-
sequent drafts of S.B. 946 excluded contracts with
Healthy Familiesand CalPERS from its coverage man-
dates.3 A Senate Appropriations Committee analysis
found that because S.B. 946 “would exempt health
plansandinsurersthat contract with Medi—Cal, Healthy
Families, and CaPERS, there would be minimal costs
to the state to pay for these mandated services.”4 The
Assembly Appropriations Committee Bill anaysis
similarly noted that S.B. 946 would create “[m]inor, if
any, state health care costs. This bill exempts health
plans provided through Medi—Cal, Healthy Families
program, and Cal PERSfromthe coveragemandate.” >

InNovember 2011, the DMHC informed somehealth
careserviceplansthat despite Section 1374.73(d), it be-
lieved that, pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
1374.72, health care service plans should cover BHT
for autism and pervasivedevel opmental disorder for the
Public Purchaser enrollees, though not Medi—Cal en-
rollees. Moreover, in or around March 2012, the
DMHC confirmed with the California Association of
Health Plans that it had begun an emergency rulemak-
ing processto addressitsinterpretation of S.B. 946 and
Section 1374.72. Health care service plans have been
awaiting theissuance of theseemergency regulations.

Itisour further understanding that Public Purchasers
interpret Section 1374(d) differently thanthe DMHC's
apparent interpretation. Health care service plans and
Public Purchasers negotiate premium ratesbased on the
totality of covered services. Therefore, inclusion or ex-
clusion of a particular set of services will necessarily,
and possibly materialy, impact the premium. Accord-
ingly, it is essential for health care service plans and
Public Purchasers to have a meeting of the minds re-
garding the scope of contractually covered services.
However, the current uncertainty and confusion pre-
cludesameeting of the mindsabout asufficient and sus-
tainablepremium.

It is our further understanding that several Regional
Centers assume that effective July 1, 2012, they will
discontinue providing BHT to health care service plan
enrollees and refer their clients, including Public Pur-
chaser enrollees, tothe health care serviceplan or insur-
er with whom a client is enrolled. The Regional Cen-
ters' anticipated plansexacerbatethe current regulatory

2 California Health Benefit Review Program, Analysis of Senate
Bill TBD 1: Health Care Coverage: Autism, at 16, Table 1 (March
20, 2011).

3 Fiscal Summary, supranote1 (“. . .inadditiontoplansandin-
surers contracting with Medi—Cal, [ S.B. 946] would exempt plans
and insurers contracting with Healthy Families and CalPERS.”).
41d. at p. 3.

5 Cdlifornia State Assembly Appropriations Committee Bill
Analysis, September 8, 2011, at p. 2.

1488



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

and contract uncertainty with respect to Public Purchas-
ers and their enrollees and underscore the urgent need
for clarifying regulations.

Based on the forgoing, Petitioner requests that
DMHC completeits emergency rulemaking as soon as
possibleinlight of theJuly 1, 2012 effectivedate of S.B.
946.

Promulgation of regulations will clarify Public Pur-
chaser enrollees’ expectations about their benefits and
enable Public Purchaser enrollees to make informed
plansand decisionsabout the needsof their children.

It will establish clear and fair guidance for all health
care service plans as they complete their implementa-
tionin preparation for the July 1, 2012 effective date of
S.B. 946.

It will enable health care service plans and Public
Purchasers to agree on the scope of contractual cover-
age and enable negotiation of premiums appropriately
reflecting thescopeof coverage.

It will eliminate the uncertainty and confusion that
doesnot serveanyone.

Werespectfully await the DMHC’ sresponse.

Sincerely,
g/s
Jerry Fleming
Senior VicePresident
K aiser Foundation Health Plan, Inc.

GENERAL PUBLIC INTEREST

DEPARTMENT OF FOOD AND
AGRICULTURE

CORRECTED NOTICE OF A REQUESTED
HEARING

NOTICEISHEREBY GIVEN that the Department
of Food and Agriculture (Department) has proposed to
adopt section 1350 and amend section 1354 of Sub-
chapter 3, Chapter 1, Division 3, of Title 3 of the
CdliforniaCaode of Regulations. The proposal was pub-
lished in the California Regulatory Notice Register on
July 6, 2012 [Register 2012, No. 27—Z] but no hearing
was scheduled. The Department has received aregquest
for apublic hearing; therefore, the hearing will be held
in accordance with Government Code section 11346.8
for the proposal relating to the regulation of persons
registered with the Department to engagein businessin

Cdlifornia as an egg producer or egg handler, and any
registered out—of—state egg handler or producer selling
eggsinCalifornia.

Food and Agricultural Code section 407 authorizes
the Department to adopt such regulations that are rea
sonably necessary to carry out the provisions of the
Food and Agricultural Code which it is authorized to
administer or enforce. Sections 27521, 27531, 27533,
27541, 27573 and 27637 of the Food and Agricultural
Code authorize the Department to regulate, in part, the
marketing of shell eggssoldto consumersto assurethat
healthful and wholesome eggs of known quality are
soldinthestate. Thisproposal amendstherequirements
for the marketing of eggsin Californiaby adopting sec-
tion 1350 (Shell Egg Food Safety) and amending sec-
tion 1354 (Marking Requirements) of Subchapter 3,
Chapter 1, Division 3, of Title 3 of the California Code
of Regulations, to ensure that eggs are produced in a
uniform manner to ensurethe quality and safety of shell
eggssoldfor human consumption.

The Department is publishing this corrected no-
ticedueto a changein thehearing datefor the pre-
viously noticed public hearing in Sacramento, CA
[Register 2012, No. 38-Z]. The Sacramento hearing
date has been changed from October 2, 2012 to Oc-
tober 15,2012, asfollows:

October 15, 2012

10:00a.m.—2:00p.m.

Department of Food and Agriculture

1220 N Street, First Floor Auditorium,
Sacramento, CA 95814
ConferenceCall-InInfo:

866—762—9676; Participant Code: 5493774#

Please note: The Department may adjourn the hear-
ing prior to the posted time if all public testimony has
been received and/or no person is present that wishesto
providetestimony.

PublicComments

Any interested person, or hisor her duly authorized
representative, may appear and be heard and provide
written and/or oral testimony. Written comments may
befaxed or emailed by 5:00 p.m., the day of the hearing
to the contact person named in this Notice. All written
comments received during the original 45—day public
comment period ending August 20, 2012, or the addi-
tional 15-day public comment period ending Septem-
ber 15, 2012, or at the public hearing, will becomeapart
of the Department’sofficial rulemakingfile.

Contact Persons

Inquiries or comments concerning the substance of
the proposed regul ationsareto beaddressed to:

1489



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

Tony Herrera, Program Supervisor
Department of Food and Agriculture
Egg Safety and Quality Management
1220N Street, Sacramento, CA 95814
Telephone: (916) 900-5060

Fax: (916) 900-5334

Email: tony.herrera@cdfa.ca.gov

Thebackup contact personis:

Nancy Grillo, Regulation/L egislation Coordinator
Department of Food and Agriculture

Animal Healthand Food Safety Services

1220N Street, Sacramento, CA 95814

Telephone: (916) 900-5033

Fax: (916) 900-5332

Email: nancy.grillo@cdfa.ca.gov

WebsiteAccess

Materials regarding this proposal can be found at
http: //www.cdfa.ca.gov/ahfss/regul ations.html.

FISH AND GAME COMMISSION

NOTICE OF RECEIPT OF PETITION

NOTICE ISHEREBY GIVEN that, pursuant to the
provisions of Section 2073.3 of the Fish and Game
Code, the California Fish and Game Commission, on
September 7, 2012 received a petition from the Envi-
ronmental Protection Information Center to list the
northern spotted owl (Strix occidentalis caurina) as
threatened or endangered under the California Endan-
gered SpeciesAct.

Large areas of older, structurally complex forests
provide the habitat necessary to support viable popula-
tionsof northern spotted owls.

Pursuant to Section 2073 of the Fish and Game Code,
on September 10, 2012 the Commission transmitted the
petition to the Department of Fish and Gamefor review
pursuant to Section 2073.5 of said code. It isanticipated
that the Department’s eval uation and recommendation
relating to the petition will be received by the Commis-
sion at its February, 2013 Commission meeting. Inter-
ested parties may contact Dr. Eric Loft, Wildlife
Branch, Department of Fish and Game, 1812 Ninth
Street, Sacramento, CA 95811, or telephone
916-445-3555for information on the petition or to sub-
mit information to the Department relating to the peti-
tioned species.

DISAPPROVAL DECISON

DECISIONS OF DISAPPROVAL OF
REGULATORY ACTIONS

Printed below are the summaries of Officeof Admin-
istrative Law disapproval decisions. Thefull text of dis-
approval decisions is available at www.oal.ca.gov un-
der the“Publications’ tab. You may also request acopy
of adecision by contacting the Office of Administrative
Law, 300 Capitol Mall, Suite 1250, Sacramento, CA
958144339, (916) 323-6225— FAX (916) 323-6826.
Pleaserequest by OAL filenumber.

EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICES
AUTHORITY

Inre
Emer gency Medical ServicesAuthority

Regulatory Action:
Title22
CaliforniaCodeof Regulations

100144

100135, 100136, 100137, 100139,
100140, 100141, 100142, 100143,
100144, 100145, 100146, 100147,
100148, 100149, 100150, 100151,
100152, 100153, 100154, 100155,
100156, 100157, 100158, 100159,
100160, 100161, 100162, 100163,
100164, 100165, 100166, 100167,
100168, 100169, 100170, 100171,
100172,100173,100174,100175

Adopt sections:
Amend sections:

DECISION OF DISAPPROVAL OF
REGULATORY ACTION

Government Code Section 11349.3

OAL FileNo.2012-0801-07S

SUMMARY OF REGULATORY ACTION

The Emergency Medical Services Authority (EMSA)
proposed this action to adopt one and amend forty—one
sections pertaining to paramedics in title 22 of the
Cdifornia Code of Regulations (CCR). This action
would expand the paramedic basic scope of practice
and would also adopt a new category of paramedic

1490



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

provider: the Critical Care Transport Paramedic.
Controlled substance security policy requirements
were also added in thisrulemaking. Additionally, there
is some clean—up of language proposed throughout the
paramedic chapter.

DECISION

On September 13, 2012, the Office of Administrative
Law (OAL) notified EMSA that OAL disapproved the
proposed regulations for failure to comply with speci-
fied standardsand procedures of the CaliforniaAdmin-
istrative Procedure Act (APA). Thereasonsfor the dis-
approval aresummarized bel ow:

A. Theagency failed to comply with the “Necessity”
standard of Government Code section
11349.1(a)(1);

B. The proposed regulations failed to comply with
the “Clarity” standard of Government Code
section 11349.1(a)(3); and

C. The agency failed to comply with all required
Administrative Procedure Act procedures.

CONCLUSION

For thereasonsset forth above, OAL hasdisapproved
thisregulatory action.

Date: September 20, 2012

Peggy J. Gibson
Senior Counsel

FOR: DEBRA M.CORNEZ
Director

Original: HowardBacker
Copy: LauraLittle

SUMMARY OF REGULATORY
ACTIONS

REGULATIONS FILED WITH
SECRETARY OF STATE

This Summary of Regulatory Actions lists regula-
tionsfiled with the Secretary of State on the datesindi-
cated. Copies of the regulations may be obtained by
contacting the agency or from the Secretary of State,
Archives, 1020 O Street, Sacramento, CA 95814, (916)
653—7715. Please have the agency name and the date
filed (seebel ow) when making arequest.

Filett2012—-0816-04
BOARD OF OPTOMETRY
Renting Space& Fingerprints

This regulatory action clarifies that an optometrist
who rents or leases, and practices optometry in, acom-
mercial spaceisrequired to haveasign designating that
the rented spaceis occupied by an optometrist. Thisac-
tionalsofurther clarifieswhichlicenseesarerequiredto
submit fingerprintsduringthelicenserenewal process.

Title16

CaliforniaCodeof Regulations
AMEND: 1514, 1525.1

Filed 09/25/2012
Effective10/25/2012

Agency Contact: AndreaLeiva (916) 5757182

Filett2012-0827-01

BOARD OF STATEAND COMMUNITY
CORRECTIONS

2007 Local Jail Construction Funding

This Certificate of Compliance makes permanent the
emergency regulatory action (OAL file no.
2012-0615-02EON) that was submitted to OAL pur-
suant to Penal Code section 5058.3 as operationally
necessary. This rulemaking action amends some sec-
tions and adopts some sections within Title 15 of the
Cdlifornia Code of Regulations. Thisis CSA's imple-
mentation of the $1.2 billion 2007 Local Jail Construc-
tion Program authorized by AB 900 (Stats. 2007, Chap.
7) (Solorio) as amended by AB 111 and AB 94 (Stats.
2011). The origina legislation in AB 900 resulted in
Phase | of the Local Jail Construction Financing Pro-
gram. The 2011 Realignment Legislation Addressing
Public Safety (AB 111, CH 16, Stats. 2011 and AB 94,
CH 23, Stats. 2011) amended AB 900 and resulted in
Phase I of the Local Jail Construction Financing Pro-
gram. The package adopts 5 new regulations and
amends 27 regulations which establish Phase Il of the
county jail bond funding program. Some of the main
differencesfrom Phasel to Phasell isthedeletion of the
requirement that CSA givefunding preferenceto coun-
tiesthat assist the state in siting specified facilities and
instead requiring CSA to give preference to counties
that committed thelargest percentage of inmatesto state
custody in relation to the total inmate population of the
department in 2010. Phase |1 also deletes the provision
prohibiting the department and CSA from awarding
funds until specified construction progress and siting
requirementsare met. Further, in Phasell the minimum
25% contribution of county matching fundsis reduced
to 10%. Phase |l also allows countiesto relinquish their
Phase | funding to apply for the Phase Il funding
instead.

1491



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

Title15

CdliforniaCodeof Regulations

ADOPT: 1712.1, 1714.1, 1730.1, 1740.1, 1748.5
AMEND: 1700, 1706, 1712, 1714, 1730, 1731,
1740, 1747, 1747.1, 17475, 1748, 1751, 1752,
1753, 1754, 1756, 1760, 1766, 1767, 1768, 1770,
1772,1776,1778, 1788 REPEAL: 1757

Filed 09/25/2012

Effective09/25/2012

Agency Contact: Charlene Aboytes (916) 324-1914

File#2012-0813-02
BUREAU OFAUTOMOTIVEREPAIR
CAPApplicationand STAR Program Modifications

This change without regulatory effect simplifies and
shortens the Bureau's Consumer Assistance Program
application form, which isincorporated by referencein
section 3394.6, for ease of use by the public and to re-
duce costs of printing. The regulation changes also in-
clude non—substantive changes to the numbering of
subsections of section 3340.15 to correct for an error in
that section.

Title16

CaliforniaCodeof Regulations
AMEND: 3340.15, 3394.6
Filed 09/25/2012

Agency Contact: Alex Christian  (916) 403-8622

File#t2012-0830-01

CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL MITIGATION
PROGRAM

Conflictof Interest Code Adoption

ThisisaConflict of Interest Codefiling that hasbeen
approved by FPPC and is being submitted for filing
withthe Secretary of Stateand printingonly.

Title2

CaliforniaCodeof Regulations
ADOPT: 59730

Filed 09/20/2012
Effective10/20/2012

Agency Contact: Niel Hall (916) 325-3800

File#t2012-0827-04
DEPARTMENT OF FOOD AND AGRICULTURE
European GrapevineMoth Interior Quarantine

This certificate of compliance makes permanent the
prior emergency regulatory action (OAL file no.
2012-0301-03E) that deregul ated the entire counties of
Fresno, Mendocino, Merced and San Joaquin duetothe
eradication of the European Grapevine Moth (EGVM),

“Lobesia botrana,” in these counties, reduced the
EGVM quarantine areasin Napa, Nevada, SantaClara,
Santa Cruz, Solano and Sonomacountiesbecauseanew
federal order requires only a three-mile radius around
each |ocation where EGVM has been found instead of
the current five—mileradius, and removed “ Rubus’ asa
host plant and possible carrier of EGVM. This action
will permanently remove approximately 1,031 square
miles from the quarantine areas leaving a total of
approximately 1,303 square miles of quarantine areas
fortheEGVM inCalifornia.

Title3

CdliforniaCodeof Regulations
AMEND: 3437(b) and(c)
Filed09/21/2012

Agency Contact:

Stephen S. Brown (916) 654-1017

File#2012-0813-01
DEPARTMENT OFMOTORVEHICLES
CleanAir VehicleDecals

In thisrulemaking the Department of Motor Vehicles
isamending two sectionsin Title 13 to establish agreen
identifier, or decal, for use by advanced technol ogy par-
tial zero—emission vehicles (AT PZEV) in the high—oc-
cupancy vehicle (HOV) lanes. This rulemaking pro-
vides instructions on where to affix the decals and up-
datestheform required when applyingfor thedecals.

Title13

CdliforniaCodeof Regulations
AMEND: 156.00, 156.01

Filed 09/25/2012
Effective10/25/2012

Agency Contact:

Debbie Swank Cockrill (916) 6576469

File#2012-0918-02

DEPARTMENT OF RESOURCES RECYCLING
AND RECOVERY

Electronic WasteRecycling Fees

This emergency rulemaking action is a biennial ad-
justment of the recycling and recovery fee paid by con-
sumers on purchases of electronic devices which con-
tain video screens. The Department of Resources, Re-
cycling, and Recovery reviews and adjusts the amount
of thisfeefor the purpose of ensuring that sufficient rev-
enuesremain in the account for purposes of funding the
recycling and recovery program. This rulemaking ac-
tionlowersthefeepaid by consumers, effective January
1, 2013, to ensure that the fund account maintains only
therevenuesnecessary tofundthisprogram.

1492



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

Title14

CaliforniaCodeof Regulations
AMEND: 18660.40

Filed 09/25/2012
Effective09/25/2012

Agency Contact: HarlleeBranch  (916) 341-6056

File#2012-0824-01
FISHAND GAME COMMISSION
Waterfowl Hunting

This rulemaking by the California Fish and Game
Commission amends the migratory waterfow! hunting
season dates and bag limits for specified zones within
Cdlifornia.

Title14

CaliforniaCodeof Regulations
AMEND: 502

Filed 09/21/2012
Effective09/21/2012

Agency Contact: Sheri Tiemann  (916) 6549872

File#2012-0821-02

OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY ANDHEALTH
STANDARDSBOARD

TreeWork, Maintenanceor Removal

Thisrulemaking action updatesthe regul ations of the
Occupational Safety and Health Standards Board re-
garding treetrimming and specific to safework practic-
es, high voltage wires, tree—climbing equipment, mo-
bile equipment, portable power tools, and employee
training.

Title8

CaliforniaCodeof Regulations

AMEND: 2950, 3420, 3421, 3422, 3423, 3424,
3425, 3426, 3427 REPEAL : 3428

Filed 09/25/2012

Effective 10/25/2012

Agency Contact: Marley Hart (916) 274-5721

File#2012-0816-03
OFFICEOFENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH
HAZARD ASSESSMENT
Specific Regulatory Levels Posing No Significant
Risk: NSRL for TDCPP

This regulatory action adopts a No Significant Risk
Level (NSRL) for tris(1,3—dichloro—2—propyl) phos-
phate (TDCPP) of 5.4 micrograms per day based on a
carcinogenicity study inrodents.

Title27

CaliforniaCodeof Regulations
AMEND: 25705(b)

Filed 09/20/2012
Effective10/20/2012

Agency Contact: Susan L uong (916) 327-3015

Filet#2012-0814-01
STATECONTROLLER SOFFICE
Unclaimed Property

Thisrulemaking action by the State Controller’s Of-
ficeamendssections 1155.250 and 1155.350 of title 2 of
the California Code of Regulations by updating three
forms incorporated by reference and removing lan-
guage for which statutory authority has been repeal ed.
These amendments make the unclaimed property re-
porting processmoreaccurateand efficient.

Title2

CaliforniaCodeof Regulations
AMEND: 1155.250, 1155.350
Filed09/19/2012
Effective10/19/2012

Agency Contact:

David Brownfield (916) 322-7535

CCR CHANGES FILED
WITH THE SECRETARY OF STATE
WITHIN May 2, 2012 TO
September 26, 2012

All regulatory actionsfiled by OAL during this peri-
od are listed below by California Code of Regulations
titles, then by datefiled with the Secretary of State, with
theManual of Policiesand Procedures changes adopted
by the Department of Social Serviceslistedlast. For fur-
ther information on a particular file, contact the person
listed in the Summary of Regulatory Actions section of
the Notice Register published on the first Friday more
thanninedaysafter thedatefiled.

Title2

09/20/12 ADOPT: 59730

09/19/12 AMEND: 1155.250, 1155.350

09/14/12 REPEAL:52100

09/10/12 ADOPT: 59650

08/30/12 AMEND: 60000, 60010, 60300, 60310,
60323, 60325, 60330, 60400, 60550,
60560, 60600, 60610 REPEAL: 60020,
60025, 60030, 60040, 60045, 60050,
60055, 60100, 60110, 60200

08/16/12 AMEND: 1859.2, 1859.61, 1859.74,
1859.77.1, 1859.79, 1859.79.2,

1493



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

08/13/12
08/07/12
07/16/12
07/09/12

06/28/12
06/19/12
06/04/12
05/29/12
05/15/12
05/10/12
05/08/12

Title3
09/21/12
09/18/12
09/12/12
09/12/12
08/24/12
08/22/12
08/20/12
08/06/12
06/19/12
05/17/12

Title4
09/12/12

09/04/12
08/30/12
08/29/12
08/01/12
08/01/12

07/26/12
07/26/12

07/23/12
07/16/12

06/25/12
06/25/12

06/06/12
06/01/12

05/15/12

1859.79.3, 1859.83, 1859.104 REPEAL :
1859.70.3,  1859.71.5,  1859.78.9,
1859.93.2, 1859.93.3

ADOPT: 59720

AMEND: 18640

AMEND: 18215.3

ADOPT: 22620.1, 22620.2, 22620.3,
22620.4, 226205, 22620.6, 22620.7,
22620.8

AMEND: 649.32

AMEND: 56800

ADOPT: 18313.6

AMEND: 20811(c)

AMEND: 1859.2

AMEND: 1859.2, 1859.82

ADOPT: 559.1

AMEND: 3437(b) and ()

AMEND: 6449.1, 6486.7

AMEND: 3700(c)

AMEND: 3435(b)

AMEND: 3406(b)

AMEND: 6800(b)

AMEND: 3435(b)

AMEND: 3435(b)

ADOPT: 6970, 6972 AMEND: 6000
AMEND: 4603(i)

ADOPT: 12391(a)(1), (3), (4), (b) & (),
12392 AMEND: 12360

AMEND: 10032, 10033, 10034, 10035
ADOPT: 1489.1

ADOPT: 5205 AMEND: 5000, 5054,
5144, 5190, 5200, 5230, 5370, 5170,
5350 REPEAL : 5133

ADOPT: 5255, 5256 AMEND: 5170,
5230, 5250, 5560, 5580

AMEND: 5000, 5052

AMEND: 8070
AMEND: 12101, 12202, 12205.1,
12218, 12218.7, 12218.8, 12222,

12225.1, 12233, 12235, 12238, 12309,
12335, 12342, 12350, 12352, 12354
AMEND: 8035

AMEND: 10050, 10051, 10052, 10053,
10054, 10055, 10056, 10057

AMEND: 8070, 8071, 8072, 8078,
8078.2

AMEND: 1663

AMEND: 1843.3

ADOPT: 5205 AMEND: 5000, 5054,
5144, 5170, 5190, 5200, 5230, 5350,
5370REPEAL: 5133

REPEAL:61.3

1494

05/04/12

Titles
09/06/12
08/09/12
08/09/12

08/09/12
08/09/12
08/09/12
08/08/12
08/08/12

07/3V112
06/12/12

05/29/12

Title7
07/03/12

Title8
09/25/12

09/05/12
09/04/12

08/07/12
07/30/12

05/21/12

05/07/12
05/07/12
05/02/12

Title9
07/27/12

Title10
08/30/12
08/27/12
08/22/12
08/03/12
07/19/12
07/19/12
07/19/12
05/31/12
05/09/12

Titlell
09/18/12

ADOPT: 10050, 10051, 10052, 10053,
10054, 10055, 10056, 10057, 10058,
10059, 10060

AMEND: 1216.1

AMEND: 40403

AMEND: 59400, 59402, 59404, 59406,
59408

AMEND: 40500

ADOPT: 40541

AMEND: 40407.1

ADOPT: 40540

ADOPT: 19824.1, 19841, 19851.1,
19854.1 AMEND: 19816, 19816.1,
19824, 19850, 19851, 19854

AMEND: 19816, 19816.1, 19845.2
ADOPT: 18004 AMEND: 18000, 18001,
18002, 18003

AMEND: 42600

AMEND: 219

AMEND: 2950, 3420, 3421, 3422, 3423,
3424, 3425, 3426, 3427 REPEAL : 3428
AMEND: 1512, 2320.10, 2940.10
AMEND: 5189, 5192(a)(3),
5198()(2)(D)2., 1532.1()(2)(D)2.
ADOPT: 3558 AMEND: 3207, 4184
ADOPT: 32802, 32804 AMEND: 32380,
32603, 32604

ADOPT: 10582.5, 10770.1 AMEND:
10770

AMEND: 477

AMEND: 2340.22

AMEND: 20363, 20365, 20393, 20400,
20402

AMEND: 71415, 7143, 7227, 7350,
7351, 7353.6, 7354, 7355, 7356, 7357,
7358, 7400

AMEND: 2468.5

AMEND: 260.204.9

ADOPT: 2327,2327.1,2327.2
ADOPT: 2561.1, 2561.2
AMEND: 2698.302

AMEND: 2699.301

AMEND: 5501, 5506
AMEND: 2318.6,2353.1, 2354
AMEND: 2698.208

AMEND: 410, 411, 415, 416, 417, 420,
421,425REPEAL:419,419.1



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

07/31/12

06/26/12
06/21/12
05/09/12
05/07/12

Title12
06/04/12

Title13
09/25/12
09/14/12
08/07/12

08/07/12

08/02/12
07/30/12
07/12/12

06/29/12

Title13,17
09/14/12

Titlel4
09/25/12
09/21/12
09/12/12
09/07/12
08/31/12
08/14/12
08/02/12

07/26/12
07/12/12
07/09/12

07/02/12
06/28/12

AMEND:
999.22
AMEND: 1005, 1007, 1008

AMEND: 1005, 1007

ADOPT: 1019 REPEAL: 9020

ADOPT: 999.24, 999.25, 999.26, 999.27,
999.28, 999.29 AMEND: 999.10,
999.11, 999.14, 999.16, 999.17, 999.19,
999.20,999.21, 999.22

999.16, 999.17, 999.19,

AMEND: 506

AMEND: 156.00, 156.01
AMEND: 2479

ADOPT: 1962.2 AMEND:
1962.2 (renumberedto 1962.3)
ADOPT: 1961.2,1961.3 AMEND: 1900,
1956.8, 1960.1, 1961, 1961.1, 1965,
1968.2, 1968.5, 1976, 1978, 2037, 2038,
2062, 2112, 2139, 2140, 2145, 2147,
2235,2317

ADOPT: 426.00

AMEND: 1268, 1270.3

ADOPT: 34558, 345.73 AMEND:
345.50, 345.52, 345.56, 345.74, 345.78,
345.86, 345.88, 345.90 REPEAL:
345.54, 345.58, 345.60

AMEND: 225.00, 225.03, 225.09,
225.12, 225.15, 225.18, 225.21, 225.24,
225.35, 225.36, 225.38, 225.42, 225.45,
225.54, 225.60, 225.63, 225.66, 225.69,
225.72REPEAL : 225.06

1962.1,

AMEND: 2299.2,93118.2

AMEND: 18660.40
AMEND: 502

AMEND: 18660.17, 18660.19, 18660.31
AMEND: 300

ADOPT: 671.8 AMEND: 671.1
AMEND: 13055

ADOPT: 2231, 2301 AMEND: 2000,
2200, 2230, 2235, 2240, 2245, 2300,
2305, 2310, 2320

AMEND: 18836

AMEND: 790, 851.20, 851.21, 851.22,
851.25 851.26, 85127, 851.27.1,
851.28, 851.29, 851.30, 851.31, 851.32
ADOPT: 1665.1, 1665.2, 1665.3, 1665.4,
1665.5, 1665.6, 1665.7, 1665.8

ADOPT: 602

ADOPT: 17944.1, 17945.1, 17945.4,
17946, 179465, 17948.1, 17948.2
AMEND: 17943, 17944, 17946(a)—(h)

06/25/12
06/06/12

06/01/12
05/30/12
05/29/12
05/21/12
05/21/12
05/21/12

05/17/12
05/07/12

Titlel5
09/25/12

09/13/12
09/13/12

08/29/12

08/20/12

07/02/12
06/26/12

06/26/12

06/26/12

06/06/12

05/10/12

1495

renumber as 17945.2, 17946(i) renumber
as 17945.3, 17946.5 renumber as
179455, 17947, 17948, 17948.5, 17949
REPEAL: 17942, 17944.2, 179445,

17945

AMEND: 791.7

ADOPT: 18950, 18951, 18952, 18953,
18954, 18955, 18955.1, 18955.2,
18955.3, 18956, 18957, 18958

REPEAL: 660

AMEND: 11960

AMEND: 360, 361, 362, 363, 364, 365,
708.12

AMEND: 703

AMEND: 7.50

AMEND: 705

AMEND: 7.50

ADOPT: 18835, 18836, 18837, 18838,
18839

ADOPT: 1712.1,1714.1,1730.1,1740.1,
17485 AMEND: 1700, 1706, 1712,
1714, 1730, 1731, 1740, 1747, 1747.1,
1747.5, 1748, 1751, 1752, 1753, 1754,
1756, 1760, 1766, 1767, 1768, 1770,
1772,1776,1778, 1788 REPEAL: 1757
AMEND: 3162

ADOPT: 3078, 3078.1, 3078.2, 3078.3,
3078.4, 3078.5, 3078.6 AMEND: 3000,
3043, 3075.2, 3097, 3195, 3320, 3323
AMEND: 2606, 2635.1, 2646.1, 2733,
2740,2743,2744

AMEND: 1006, 1007, 1008, 1012, 1013,
1024, 1032, 1044, 1046, 1051, 1055,
1056, 1058, 1059, 1062, 1063, 1069,
1072, 1080, 1081, 1083, 1084, 1100,
1104, 1125, 1140, 1141, 1143, 1144,
1145, 1146, 1147, 1148, 1149, 1151,
1203, 1205, 1206, 1208, 1217, 1241
ADOPT: 3999.12

ADOPT: 1712.1,1714.1,1730.1,1740.1,
17485 AMEND: 1700, 1706, 1712,
1714, 1730, 1731, 1740, 1747, 1747.1,
17475, 1748, 1751, 1752, 1753, 1754,
1756, 1760, 1766, 1767, 1768, 1770,
1772,1776,1778,1788 REPEAL : 1757
ADOPT: 3079, 3079.1 AMEND: 3000,
3075.2,3075.3

AMEND: 3000, 3076.1, 3076.3, 3375,
3375.1, 3375.2, 3375.3, 3375.4, 3375.5,
3377.2,3521.2

AMEND: 3000, 3006, 3170.1, 3172.1,
3173.2,3315,3323

ADOPT: 3375.6 AMEND: 3000, 3375



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

Titlel6
09/25/12
09/25/12
09/12/12
09/10/12
09/07/12
08/30/12

08/29/12

08/20/12
07/23/12
07/17/12

07/10/12
06/18/12
06/18/12
06/14/12
05/25/12

05/17/12

05/14/12
05/04/12

Title17
09/04/12
08/30/12

08/29/12
08/15/12

07/26/12
06/15/12

AMEND: 1514, 1525.1

AMEND: 3340.15, 3394.6
AMEND: 961 REPEAL : 933

ADOPT: 4116,4117,4118,4119
AMEND: 4

ADOPT: 2557, 2557.1, 2557.2, 2557.3,
2595, 2595.1, 2595.2, 2595.3

ADOPT: 4146, 4148, 4149, 4149.1
AMEND: 4100, 4101

ADOPT: 1333,1333.1,1333.2,1333.3
ADOPT: 1397.2AMEND: 1380.4
ADOPT: 1399.23, 1399.24 AMEND:
1398.4

ADOPT: 3394.25, 3394.26, 3394.27
ADOPT: 1727.2AMEND: 1728
AMEND: 443

ADOPT: 302.5

ADOPT: 1399.364, 1399.375, 1399.377,
1399.381, 1399.384 AMEND: 1399.301,
1399.302, 1399.303, 1399.320,
1399.330, 1399.352.7,  1399.353,
1399.360, 1399.370, 1399.374, 1399.376
(renumbered to 1399.382), 1399.380,
1399.382 (renumbered to 1399.383),
1399.383 (renumbered to 1399.385),
1399.384 (renumbered to 1399.378),
1399.385 (renumbered to 1399.379),
1399.395 REPEAL: 1399.340,
1399.381, 1399.387, 1399.388,
1399.389, 1399.390, 1399.391

ADOPT: 4544, 4600, 4602, 4604, 4606,
4608, 4610, 4620, 4622 AMEND: 4422,
4440, 4446, 4470

AMEND: 932

ADOPT: 2509, 2518.8, 2524.1, 2568,
2576.8, 2579.11 AMEND: 2503, 2524.1
(renumber to 2524.5), 2563, 2579.11
(renumber t0 2579.20)

ADOPT: 30305.1, 30308.1, 30311.1
AMEND: 95802, 95812, 95814, 95830,
95831, 95832, 95833, 95834, 95856,
95870, 95892, 95910, 95911, 95912,
95913, 95914, 95920, 95021

AMEND: 100800

ADOPT: 54521, 54522, 54523, 54524,
54525, 54526, 54527, 54528, 54529,
54530, 54531, 54532, 54533, 54534,
54535 AMEND: 54500, 54505, 54520
REPEAL: 54521, 54522, 54523, 54524,
54525

AMEND: 94006

AMEND: 6508

1496

Title18
08/07/12
07/27/12
07/10/12
07/10/12
07/10/12
07/10/12
07/03/12
07/03/12

Title21
08/28/12

Title22
09/06/12
08/20/12
08/13/12

07/12/12

07/12/12
07/09/12
07/03/12
06/28/12
06/21/12

06/12/12
05/24/12
05/22/12

05/17/12
05/04/12

Title23
09/06/12
08/08/12
07/30/12
07/11/12
07/05/12

Title25
08/13/12

AMEND: 1618

AMEND: 1684

AMEND: 1205, 1212,1271
AMEND: 1105, 1120, 1132, 1161
AMEND: 1435, 1436

AMEND: 25128.5

AMEND: 3301

AMEND: 263

AMEND: 6640, 6680

ADOPT: 66269.2
AMEND: 87224
AMEND: 100104, 100106, 100106.1,

100113, 100115, 100119, 100120,
100121, 100123, 100127
AMEND: 66263.18, 66263.41,

66263.43, 66263.44, 66263.45, 66263.46
AMEND: 66268.40, 66268.48

AMEND: 4416

AMEND: 51516.1

AMEND: 91477

AMEND: 50195, 50197, 50256, 50258,
50258.1, 50262, 50268, 50815, 51000.53
AMEND: 66261.32

AMEND: 90417
ADOPT: 60098, 64400.05, 64400.29,
64400.36, 64400.41, 64400.66,

64400.90, 64402.30, 64400.46 AMEND:
60001, 60003, 63790, 63835, 64001,
64211, 64212, 64213, 64252, 64254,
64256, 64257, 64258, 64259, 64400.45,
64415, 64463.1, 64463.4, 64470, 64481,
64530, 64531, 64533, 64534, 64534.2,
64534.4, 64534.6, 64534.8, 64535,
64535.2, 645354, 64536.6, 64537,
64537.2 REPEAL: 60430, 64002, 64439,
64468.5

AMEND: 51240, 51305, 51476
AMEND: 123000

ADOPT: 3959.5

ADOPT: 3969.2

ADOPT: 2923

ADOPT: 597,597.1,597.2,597.3,597.4
AMEND: 570, 571, 572, 573, 574, 575,
576

ADOPT: 7097 AMEND: 7054, 7056,
7058, 7060, 7062, 7062.1, 7072, 7076,
7078, 7104 REPEAL : 7064, 7066, 7074,



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2012, VOLUME NO. 40-Z

06/07/12

Title27
09/20/12
09/12/12
07/12/12

7078.1, 7078.2, 7078.3, 7078.4, 7078.5,
7078.6,7078.7

ADOPT: 4326, 4328 AMEND: 4004,
4200, 4204, 4208

AMEND: 25705(b)
AMEND: 25403(a), 25603.3(a)
AMEND: 25305, 25701, 25705, 25801

06/18/12

Title28
09/06/12

TitleM PP
06/25/12

1497

AMEND: 25705
ADOPT: 1300.74.73

AMEND: 40-105.4(g)(1), 44-111.23,
44-113.2, 44-133.54(QR),
44-315.39(QR), 89-201.513





